
                                                  INVITATION TO BID NO:  10-X-2216943
                      
                      STATE OF ALABAMA
 
                   DEPTARTMENT OF FINANCE         REQ. AGENCY        : 005045
                   DIVISION OF PURCHASING                             ALABAMA CORRECTIONAL INDUSTRIES
                                                  AGENCY REQ. NO.    :
                                                  T-NUMBER           : TA034
                                                  DATE ISSUED        : 03/10/10
                     INVITATION TO BID            VENDOR NO.         :
                                                  VENDOR PHONE NO.   :
                                                  SNAP REQ. NO.      : 1436863
                                                  BUYER NAME         : JANNA WICKHAM
                      
 FOR:    UPHOLSTERY FABRIC - ACI                  BUYER PHONE NO.    : (334) 242-4288-
                                                  PURCHASING PHONE NO: (334) 242-7250
 
                                                   BID MUST BE RECEIVED BEFORE:
                                                   DATE:  04/08/10  TIME:  5:00  PM
 
                                                   BIDS WILL BE PUBLICLY OPENED:
                                                   DATE:  04/09/10  TIME:  10:00 AM
 
                         TO BE COMPLETED BY VENDOR
 
  INFORMATION IN THIS SECTION SHOULD BE PROVIDED, AS APPROPRIATE.  BID RESPONSE
  MUST BE IN INK OR TYPED WITH ORIGINAL SIGNATURE AND NOTARIZATION.
 
 1. DELIVERY: CAN BE MADE _________ DAYS OR _________ WEEKS AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDER
 
 2. TERMS: ________________(DISCOUNTS ARE TAKEN WITHOUT REGARD TO DATE OF PAYMENT.)
 
 3. PRICE VALID FOR ACCEPTANCE WITHIN ____________ DAYS.
 
 4. VENDOR QUOTATION REFERENCE NUMBER, IF ANY: ______________
    (THIS NUMBER WILL APPEAR ON THE PURCHASE ORDER.)
 
 5. E-MAIL ADDRESS: ______________________________________________________
 
    INTERNET WEBSITE:  ___________________________________________________
 
 6. GENERAL CONTRACTOR'S LICENSE NO: _____________________________________
 
    TYPE OF G.C. LICENSE: ________________________________________________
 
                             ***** IMPORTANT NOTE: *****
    BIDDERS MUST COMPLY WITH ALL "BID RESPONSE INSTRUCTIONS" ON PAGE 2, TO INCLUDE
    ITEM 7 - COPY REQUIREMENT.
 
     RETURN INVITATION TO BID:
 
                   US MAIL                                  COURIER
            _____________________                    _____________________
 
            STATE OF ALABAMA                         STATE OF ALABAMA
            DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE                    DIVISION OF PURCHASING
            DIVISION OF PURCHASING                   RSA UNION BUILDING
            P O BOX 302620                           100 N. UNION ST., SUITE 192
            MONTGOMERY, AL 36130-2620                MONTGOMERY, AL 36104
 
                         SIGNATURE AND NOTARIZATION REQUIRED
 I HAVE READ THE ENTIRE BID AND AGREE TO FURNISH EACH ITEM OFFERED AT THE PRICE QUOTED.
 I HERBY AFFIRM I HAVE NOT BEEN IN ANY AGREEMENT OR COLLUSION AMONG BIDDERS IN
 RESTRAINT OF FREEDOM OF COMPETITION BY AGREEMENT TO BID AT A FIXED PRICE OR TO
 REFRAIN FROM BIDDING.
 
 
 SWORN TO AND                  _________________________     _________________________
                               FEIN OR SSN                   AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE (INK)
 
 SUBSCRIBED BEFORE ME THIS     _________________________     _________________________
                               COMPANY NAME                  TYPE/PRINT AUTHORIZED NAME
 
 ______ DAY OF ___________     _________________________     _________________________
                               MAIL ADDRESS                  TITLE
 
 _________________________     _________________________     _________________________
 NOTARY PUBLIC                 CITY, STATE, ZIP              TOLL FREE NUMBER
 
 TERM EXP: _______________     _________________________     _________________________
                               PHONE INCLUDING AREA CODE     FAX NUMBER
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   AUTHORITY:
       THE DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE CODE OF ADMINISTRATIVE PROCEDURE, CHAPTER  355-4-1 EFFECTIVE
       DECEMBER 20, 2001 IS INCORPORATED BY REFERENCE AND MADE A PART OF T HIS DOCUMENT.  TO RECEIVE A
       COPY CALL (334)242-7250, OR OUR WEBSITE  WWW.PURCHASING.ALABAMA.GOV .
 
   INFORMATION AND ASSISTANCE TO MINORITY AND WOMEN-OWNED BUSINESSES IN ACQUIRING M/WBE CERTIFICATION MAY
   BE OBTAINED FROM THE OFFICE OF MINORITY BUSINESS ENTERPRISE, 1-800-447-4191.
 
                        BID (ITB) RESPONSE INSTRUCTIONS                 REV: 01/14/10
 
   1.  TO SUBMIT A RESPONSIVE BID, READ THESE INSTRUCTIONS, ALL TERMS, CONDITIONS AND SPECIFICATIONS.
 
   2.  BID ENVELOPES/PACKAGES/BOXES MUST BE IDENTIFIED ON FRONT, PREFERABLY LOWER LEFT CORNER AND BE
       VISIBLE WITH THE BID NUMBER AND OPENING DATE.  EACH INDIVIDUAL BID (IDENTIFIED BY A UNIQUE BID
       NUMBER) MUST BE SUBMITTED IN A SEPARATE ENVELOPE.  RESPONSES TO MULTIPLE BID NUMBERS SUBMITTED IN
       THE SAME ENVELOPE/COURIER PACKAGE, THAT ARE NOT IN SEPARATE ENVELOPES PROPERLY IDENTIFIED, WILL
       BE REJECTED.  THE DIVISION OF PURCHASING DOES NOT ASSUME RESPONSIBILITY FOR LATE BIDS FOR ANY
       REASON INCLUDING THOSE DUE TO POSTAL, OR COURIER SERVICE.  BID RESPONSES MUST BE IN THE DIVISION
       OF PURCHASING OFFICE PRIOR TO THE "RECEIVE DATE AND TIME" INDICATED ON THE BID.
 
   3.  BID RESPONSES (PAGE 1, PRICE SHEET AND ADDENDUMS (WHEN SIGNATURE IS REQUIRED)) MUST BE IN INK OR
       TYPED ON THIS DOCUMENT.  OR EXACT FORMAT WITH SIGNATURES BEING HANDWRITTEN ORIGINALS IN INK
       (PERSON SIGNING BID, NOTARY, AND NOTARY EXPIRATION), OR THE BID WILL BE REJECTED.  UNLESS INDICATED
       IN THE BID, ALL PRICE PAGES MUST BE COMPLETED AND RETURNED.  IF AN ITEM IS NOT BEING BID, IDENTIFY
       IT AS NB (NO-BID).  PAGES SHOULD BE SECURED.  THE DIVISION OF PURCHASING DOES NOT ASSUME
       RESPONSIBILITY FOR MISSING PAGES.  FAXED BID RESPONSES WILL NOT BE ACCEPTED.
 
   4.  THE UNIT PRICE ALWAYS GOVERNS REGARDLESS OF THE EXTENDED AMOUNT. A UNIT PRICE CHANGE ON A LINE
       MUST BE INITIALED BY THE PERSON SIGNING THE BID, OR THAT LINE WILL BE REJECTED.  THIS INCLUDES A
       CROSS-OUT, STRIKE-OVER, INK-OVER, WHITE-OUT, ERASURE, OR ANY OTHER METHOD CHANGING THE PRICE.
 
   5.  A "NO BID" MUST BE RETURNED TO REMAIN ON A CLASS/SUBCLASS.  RETURN PAGE 1 OR NOTIFICATION PAGE
       MARKED "NO-BID".  IDENTIFY IT ON THE ENVELOPE AS A "NO-BID".  FAILING TO RESPOND TO 3 ITB'S WITHIN
       THE SAME CLASS/SUBCLASS WILL AUTOMATICALLY PURGE THE VENDOR FROM THAT CLASS/SUBCLASS.  RESPONDING
       WITH 6 "NO-BIDS" WITHIN THE SAME CLASS/SUBCLASS WILL AUTOMATICALLY PURGE THE VENDOR FROM THAT CLASS/
       SUBCLASS.  A "NO-BID" RECEIVED LATE IS CONSIDERED A NO RESPONSE.
 
   6.  THE DIVISION OF PURCHASING IS NOT RESPONSIBLE FOR MISINTERPRETATION OF DATA FAXED FROM THIS OFFICE.
 
   7.  THE DIVISION OF PURCHASING REQUIRES AN ORIGINAL AND A MINIMUM OF ONE COMPLETE EXACT COPY (TO INCLUDE
       SIGNATURE AND NOTARY) OF THE INVITATION-TO-BID RESPONSE. THE ORIGINAL AND THE COPY SHOULD BE
       SUBMITTED TOGETHER AS A BID PACKAGE.  FAILURE TO MARK RESPONSES AS "ORIGINAL" AND/OR "COPY" COULD
       RESULT IN THE ENTIRE BID RESPONSE BEING REJECTED.
 
   8.  AN IMPROPERLY SUBMITTED BID, LATE BID, OR BID THAT IS CANCELLED ON OR BEFORE THE OPENING DATE WILL
       BE HELD FOR 90 DAYS AND THEN DESTROYED. THE BID MUST BE RETRIEVED DURING REGULAR WORK HOURS,
       MONDAY - FRIDAY, EXCEPT STATE HOLIDAYS. AFTER THE BID IS DESTROYED, THE DIVISION OF PURCHASING
       ASSUMES NO RESPONSIBILITY FOR THE DOCUMENT.
 
                                         DISQUALIFIED/CANCELLED BID
 
   BIDS THAT ARE IMPROPERLY SUBMITTED OR RECEIVED LATE WILL BE A RESPONSE FOR RECORD, BUT WILL NOT BE
   RETURNED OR A NOTIFICATION MAILED.
 
   THE FOLLOWING IS A PARTIAL LIST WHEREBY A BID RESPONSE WILL BE DISQUALIFIED:
 
      BID NUMBER NOT ON FACE OF ENVELOPE/COURIER PACKAGE/BOX
      RESPONSES TO MULTIPLE BID NUMBERS IN SAME ENVELOPE NOT PROPERLY IDENTIFIED
      BID RECEIVED LATE
      BID NOT SIGNED/NOT ORIGINAL SIGNATURE
      BID NOT NOTARIZED/NOT ORIGINAL SIGNATURE OF NOTARY AND/OR NO NOTARY EXPIRATION
      NOTARIZED OWN SIGNATURE
      REQUIRED INFORMATION NOT SUBMITTED WITH BID
      FAILURE TO SUBMIT THE ORIGINAL BID AND A COMPLETE EXACT COPY
 
                               CERTIFICATION PURSUANT TO ACT NO. 2006-557
 
   ALABAMA LAW (SECTION 41-4-116,CODE OF ALABAMA 1975) PROVIDES THAT EVERY BID SUBMITTED AND CONTRACT
   EXECUTED SHALL CONTAIN A CERTIFICATION THAT THE VENDOR, CONTRACTOR, AND ALL OF ITS AFFILIATES THAT
   MAKE SALES FOR DELIVERY INTO ALABAMA OR LEASES FOR USE IN ALABAMA ARE REGISTERED, COLLECTING, AND
   REMITTING ALABAMA STATE AND LOCAL SALES, USE, AND/OR LEASE TAX ON ALL TAXABLE SALES AND LEASES INTO
   ALABAMA.  BY SUBMITTING THIS BID, THE BIDDER IS HEARBY CERTIFYING THAT THEY ARE IN FULL COMPLIANCE
   WITH ACT NO. 2006-557, THEY ARE NOT BARRED FROM BIDDING OR ENTERING INTO A CONTRACT PURSUANT TO
   41-4-116, AND ACKNOWLEDGES THAT THE AWARDING AUTHORITY MAY DECLARE THE CONTRACT VOID IF THE
   CERTIFICATION IS FALSE.
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                                INTENT TO AWARD
 
     EFFECTIVE MAY 1, 2008, THE STATE OF ALABAMA - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
     WILL ISSUE AN 'INTENT TO AWARD' BEFORE A FINAL AWARD IS MADE.  THE
     'INTENT TO AWARD' WILL CONTINUE FOR A PERIOD OF FIVE (5) CALENDAR
     DAYS, AFTER WHICH A PURCHASE ORDER WILL BE PRODUCED.  UPON FINAL
     AWARD, ALL RIGHTS TO PROTEST ARE FORFEITED.  A DETAILED EXPLANATION
     OF THIS PROCESS MAY BE REVIEWED IN THE ALABAMA ADMINISTRATIVE CODE -
     CHAPTER 355-4-1(14).
 
                              ALTERNATE BID RESPONSE
     UNLESS STATED ELSEWHERE IN THIS INVITATION-TO-BID (ITB) THE STATE OF
     ALABAMA WILL ACCEPT AND EVALUATE ALTERNATE BID SUBMITTALS ON ANY
     ITB'S.  ALTERNATE BID RESPONSES WILL BE EVALUATED ACCORDING TO THE
     REQUIREMENTS AS ALL OTHER RESPONSES TO THIS ITB.
 
                            INTERNET WEBSITE LINK'S
 
     INTERNET AND/OR WEBSITE LINKS WILL NOT BE ACCEPTED IN BID RESPONSES
     AS A MEANS TO SUPPLY ANY REQUIREMENTS STATED IN THIS ITB (INVITATION-
     TO-BID).
 
                PRODUCT DELIVERY, RECEIVING AND ACCEPTANCE
     IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE UNIVERSAL COMMERCE CODE (CODE OF ALABAMA,
     TITLE 7), AFTER DELIVERY, THE STATE OF ALABAMA HAS THE RIGHT TO
     INSPECT ALL PRODUCTS BEFORE ACCEPTING.  THE STATE WILL INSPECT
     PRODUCTS IN A REASONABLE TIMEFRAME.  SIGNATURE ON A DELIVERY DOCUMENT
     DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACCEPTANCE BY THE STATE.  THE STATE WILL ACCEPT
     PRODUCTS ONLY AFTER SATISFACTORY INSPECTION.
 
                                 SALES TAX EXEMPTION
 
     PURSUANT TO THE CODE OF ALABAMA, 1975, TITLE 40-23-4 (A) (11), THE
     STATE OF ALABAMA IS EXEMPT FROM PAYING SALES TAX.  AN EXEMPTION LETTER
     WILL BE FURNISHED UPON REQUEST.
 
                                   INVOICES
 
     INQUIRIES CONCERNING PAYMENT AFTER INVOICES HAVE BEEN SUBMITTED ARE
     TO BE DIRECTED TO THE RECEIVING AGENCY, NOT THE DIVISION OF PURCHASING
 
                         BID RESPONSES AND BID RESULTS
 
     UNEVALUATED BID RESPONSES (NOT BID RESULTS) ARE AVAILABLE ON OUR WEB
     SITE AT WWW.PURCHASING.ALABAMA.GOV. BID RESULTS WILL BE MADE AVAILABLE
     FOR REVIEW IN THE DIVISION OF PURCHASING OFFICE, BUT ONLY AFTER THE
     BID HAS BEEN AWARDED.  WE DO NOT FAX OR MAIL COPIES OF BID RESULTS.
     IF A VENDOR WISHES TO REVIEW BID RESULTS IN OUR OFFICE, THEY SHOULD
     FAX THEIR REQUEST TO REVIEW THE BID TWO DAYS IN ADVANCE TO THE "BID
     REVIEW CLERK" AT (334) 242-4419.  BE SURE TO REFERENCE THE BID NUMBER.
 
                 FOREIGN CORPORATION - CERTIFICATE OF AUTHORITY
 
     ALABAMA LAW PROVIDES THAT A FOREIGN CORPORATION (AN OUT-OF-STATE
     COMPANY/FIRM) MAY NOT TRANSACT BUSINESS IN THE STATE OF ALABAMA UNTIL
     IT OBTAINS A CERTIFICATE OF AUTHORITY FROM THE SECRETARY OF STATE.
     SECTION 10-2B-15.01, CODE OF ALABAMA 1975.  TO OBTAIN FORMS FOR A
     CERTIFICATE OF AUTHORITY, CONTACT THE SECRETARY OF STATE, CORPORATIONS
     DIVISION, (334) 242-5324.  THE CERTIFICATE OF AUTHORITY DOES NOT KEEP
     THE VENDOR FROM SUBMITTING A BID.
 
                             BID IDENTIFICATION
 
     REFERENCE PAGE 2, ITEM 2.  DUE TO THE POSTAL SERVICE PUTTING BAR CODE
     LABELS ON ENVELOPES, IT CONCEALS THE BID NUMBER AND DATE IF THE VENDOR
     HAS WRITTEN THEM OTHER THAN THE LOWER LEFT CORNER, THEREFORE THE BID
     WOULD BE REJECTED FOR NOT BEING PROPERLY IDENTIFIED.
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     PURPOSE:
     TO ESTABLISH A CONTRACT FOR THE ITEMS LISTED TO BE PURCHASED BY
     ALABAMA CORRECTIONAL INDUSTRIES ONLY.
 
     AWARD:
     EACH ITEM MUST BE PRICED SEPARATELY; HOWEVER, AN "ALL OR NONE" AWARD
     MAY BE MADE TO INSURE COMPATIBILITY AND/OR MAINTENANCE INTEGRITY
     WHERE APPLICABLE.
 
     DELIVERY INSTRUCTIONS:
     DELIVERIES WILL BE MADE TO EITHER OF THE FOLLOWING LOCATIONS AND
     DELIVERY ADDRESS WILL BE INDICATED ON THE PURCHASE ORDERS.
 
     ACI VENTRESS FURNITURE ASSEMBLY
     PLANT SUPERVISOR, MARK SMITHERMAN
     379 HWY 239 N
     CLAYTON AL  36016
     OFFICE: 334-775-7400
     FAX: 334-775-9334
     DELIVERY TIMES:  8:00-10:30 AM  & 11:30-2:30 PM  MON - FRI
 
     ACI
     ST CLAIR RESTORATION PLANT
     PLANT SUPERVISOR - MILTON WORKS
     1000 ST CLAIR RD
     SPRINGVILLE AL  35146
     PHONE: 205-467-2364
     FAX: 205-467-2451
     DELIVERY TIMES:  8:00 AM - 1:30 PM   MON - FRI
 
     DEFAULT:
     WHEN A VENDOR DEFAULTS ON A CONTRACT/PURCHASE ORDER, THE STATE CAN
     PROCURE THE GOODS OR SERVICES FROM OTHER SOURCES AND HOLD THE VENDOR
     RESPONSIBLE FOR ANY EXCESS IN PRICE/HANDLING.  THE VENDOR MAY BE
     BARRED FROM BIDDING FOR AN INDETERMINATE PERIOD.
 
     DELIVERY:
     VENDOR(S) MUST MAINTAIN AN INVENTORY SUFFICIENT TO FURNISH ANY OR ALL
     COLORS FIVE (5) DAYS AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDER (ARO) TO ANY LOCATION
     SPECIFIED IN THIS SOLICITATION.  THE AWARDED VENDOR SHALL RE
     RESPONSIBLE FOR DELIVERY OF ALL ITEMS UPON RECEIPT OF ORDER(S) WITHIN
     FIVE (5) DAYS.  IF THE VENDOR'S PRIMARY SOURCE OF SHIPPING BECOMES
     INCAPABLE, FOR WHATEVER REASON, THE AWARDED VENDOR SHALL PROVIDE A
     SECONDARY SOURCE OF SHIPPING TO FULFILL ALL GUIDELINES OF DELIVERY
     AND CONTRACT PERIOD.  ACI SHALL NOT BE PENALIZED WITH ADDITIONAL
     CHARGES DUE TO THE VENDOR HAVING TO USE A SECONDARY SOURCE OF
     SHIPPING.
 
     FREIGHT:
     BID IS F.O.B. DESTINATION.  ANY FREIGHT CHARGES MUST BE INCLUDED IN
     THE BID PRICES.  FREIGHT MUST NOT BE SHOWN SEPARATELY ON THE ITB OR
     INVOICES.
 
     CONTRACT PERIOD:
     ESTABLISH A 12 MONTH CONTRACT WITH AN OPTION TO EXTEND FOR A SECOND,
     AND THIRD 12 MONTH PERIOD WITH THE SAME PRICING, TERMS AND CONDITIONS.
     THE SECOND AND THIRD 12 MONTH PERIOD, IF AGREED BY BOTH PARTIES,
     WOULD BEGIN THE DAY AFTER THE FIRST OR SECOND 12 MONTH PERIOD
     EXPIRES.  ANY SUCCESSIVE EXTENSION MUST HAVE WRITTEN APPROVAL OF BOTH
     THE STATE AND VENDOR NO LATER THAN 30 DAYS PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF THE
     PREVIOUS 12 MONTH PERIOD.
 
     NON-APPROPRIATION OF FUNDS:
     CONTINUATION OF ANY AGREEMENT BETWEEN THE STATE AND A BIDDER BEYOND A
     FISCAL YEAR IS CONTINGENT UPON CONTINUED LEGISLATIVE APPROPRIATION OF
     FUNDS FOR THE PURPOSE OF THIS BID AND ANY RESULTING AGREEMENT. NON-
     AVAILABILITY OF FUNDS AT ANY TIME SHALL CAUSE ANY AGREEMENT TO BECOME
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     VOID AND UNENFORCEABLE AND NO LIQUIDATED DAMAGES SHALL ACCRUE TO THE
     STATE AS A RESULT. THE STATE WILL NOT INCUR LIABILITY BEYOND THE
     PAYMENT OF ACCRUED AGREEMENT PAYMENT.
 
     PRORATION:
     ANY PROVISION OF A CONTRACT RESULTING FROM THIS BID TO THE CONTRARY
     NOTWITHSTANDING, IN THE EVENT OF FAILURE OF THE STATE TO MAKE PAYMENT
     HEREUNDER AS A RESULT OF PARTIAL UNAVAILABILITY, AT THE TIME SUCH
     PAYMENT IS DUE, OF SUCH SUFFICIENT REVENUES OF THE STATE TO MAKE SUCH
     PAYMENT (PRORATION OF APPROPRIATED FUNDS FOR THE STATE HAVING BEEN
     DECLARED BY THE GOVERNOR PURSUANT TO SECTION 41-4-90 OF THE CODE OF
     ALABAMA 1975), THE CONTRACTOR SHALL HAVE THE OPTION, IN ADDITION TO
     THE OTHER REMEDIES OF THE CONTRACT, OF RENEGOTIATING THE CONTRACT
     (EXTENDING OR CHANGING PAYMENT TERMS OR AMOUNTS) OR TERMINATING THE
     CONTRACT.
 
     PAYMENT:
     INVOICES WILL NOT BE PAID UNTIL ALL ITEMS HAVE BEEN DELIVERED TO THE
     DESTINATION IN SATISFACTORY CONDITION.  INVOICES MUST BE IN DUPLICATE
     AND ACCOMPANY EACH SHIPMENT.
 
     BLANK LINES:
     TO EVALUATE THE BID IN AN EFFICIENT MANNER, THE VENDOR SHOULD FILL-IN
     ALL BLANK LINES APPLICABLE TO A SPECIFIC COMMODITY DESCRIPTION.
 
     REQUESTED INFORMATION:
     ANY ADDITIONAL INFORMATION REQUESTED FROM A VENDOR MUST BE FURNISHED
     WITHIN FIVE (5) DAYS FROM RECEIPT OF REQUEST.
 
     ANY SAMPLES REQUESTED BY VENDOR FOR USE IN EVALUATING THE BID MUST BE
     FURNISHED WITH FIVE (5) DAYS AND AT NO COST TO THE STATE.  SAMPLES
     MUST BE IDENTIFIED WITH THE BID NUMBER AND BID LINE NUMBER.  THESE
     SAMPLES WILL NOT BE RETURNED TO THE VENDOR.
 
     PRICE DECREASES:
     THE BUYER SHALL BE NOTIFIED IMMMEDIATELY IF THERE ARE ANY PRICE
     DECREASES AFFECTING A STATE TERM CONTRACT.  THE STATE SHALL RECEIVE
     THE BENEFIT OF THE DECREASE AS SOON AS POSSIBLE IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE
     WRITTEN NOTIFICATION FROM THE CONTRACT VENDOR.
 
     QUANTITY:
     THE EXACT QUANTITY OF EACH ITEM IS UNKNOWN. THE DIVISION OF PURCHASING
     DOES NOT GUARANTEE THE STATE WILL BUY ANY AMOUNT.  ORDERS WILL BE
     PLACED BY ACI AS NEEDED AND WILL GIVE COMPLETE SHIPPING INSTRUCTIONS.
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  LINE                                                                              EXTENDED
   NO.     COMMODITY/SERVICE DESCRIPTION        QUANTITY UNIT   UNIT PRICE           AMOUNT
 _____________________________________________________________________________________________
 
        UNLESS SPECIFIED OTHERWISE BELOW:
       SHIP TO:        R1     /
       STATEWIDE
 
 
 
 
 00001 COMMODITY CODE: 265-46-080745                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       VINYL, UPHOLSTERY 54"W, FACE: SKIN COAT
       .0065 MIL, BACKING: 3.0 OZ. POLY/COTTON
       KNIT. WEIGHT: 36 OZ./LINEAR YD.
       FLAMMABILITY: FEDERAL SPEC. CCC-A-680A
       CLASS 2 TREATMENTS (AL-B-C), BIFMA CLASS
       I.
 
       MFR:_________________PATTERN:___________
       OMNOVA COLORGUARD
 
 00002 COMMODITY CODE: 265-46-080742                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       VINYL, UPHOLSTERY 54"W, 5.0 OZ. POLY/
       FOAM (NON-WOVEN) BACKING. WEIGHT: 24 OZ/
       LINEAR YD., FLAMMABILITY: CALIFORNIA
       TECH BULLETIN #117-75 SEC. E
 
       MFR:_________________PATTERN:___________
       OMNOVA SOLUTIONS,  SAVOY
 
 00003 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-085993                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, UPHOLSTERY, PURETSIMPLE
       COLLECTION, 100% POLYESTER
       MINIMUM 11.5 OZ / LINEAR YARD, 54" WIDE
       SURFACE ABRASION:  90,000 DOUBLE RUBS
       REPEAT:  .50"H & 1"V
       TENSILE STRENGTH: WARP 60 LBS, FILL
       43 LBS
       LIGHT-FASTNESS:  EXCEEDS 60 HRS, CLASS 5
       FLAMMABILITY:  PASSES THE FOLLOWING
       CAL. 117-E, UFAC, BIFMA, AND NFPA 200189
       CLASS 1
       CLEANING CODE: WS
       STAIN PROTECTOR:  DUPONT TEFLON
 
       MFR:_________________PATTERN:___________
       ABSECON MILLS         FOUNDATION
 
 
 00004 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-085994                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, UPHOLSTERY, CONTENTS 61% ACRYLIC
       39% POLYESTER, WIDTH 54", WEIGHT 13.7 OZ
       PER LINEAR YARD. REPEAT 2.25" X V 2.5"
       ACRYLIC BACKING. FLAME RESISTANCE MEETS
       FIRECODES, CALIF. 117, SEC. E, NFPA
       260-1989 UFAC CLASS/BREAKING STRENGTH
       EXCEEDS 50 LBS. TEAR RESISTANCE EXCEEDS
       6 LBS.
 
       MFR:_________________PATTERN:___________
       CONE JACQUARDS,  PRIVIT
       ALL COLORS
 
 00005 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-091774                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, UPHOLSTERY 100% POLYESTER; 54"
 
 
 
            PAGE TOTAL                                                            ______________
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   NO.     COMMODITY/SERVICE DESCRIPTION        QUANTITY UNIT   UNIT PRICE           AMOUNT
 _____________________________________________________________________________________________
 
       WIDTH; SOIL AND STAIN RESISTANT;
       FLAMMABILITY SPECS CA BULLETIN 117 SEC.
       E, UFAC CLASS 1, ASTM E84: ABRASION
       RATING 60, D.R.; COLORFAST NESS TO
       LIGHT RATING AATCC16A, CLASS 4; HOURS
       EXPOSED TO LIGHT 40; CROCKING DRY 5.0,
       WET 5.0; PILLING RESISTANCE 5.0; SEAM
       SLIPPAGE WARP 31.0 FILL 38.0; TENSILE
       STRENGTH WARP 17900 FILL 214.0; REPEAT
       LENGTH 3.0000 INCHES WIDTH 4.5000 INCHES
       CLEANING CODE: WS WATER-BASED CLEANING
       AGENTS OR FOAM WEIGHT PER LIN. YD. 0.68
       LB; THREAD COUNT 48 PICKS, ENDS 174; DYE
       YARN.
 
       BRAND: _____________PATTERN:____________
       MOMENTUM, TREK
       ALL COLORS
 
 00006 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-085996                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, UPHOLSTERY, CONTENTS 58% COTTON
       42% POLYESTER STANDARD WIDTH, 54" REPEAT
       H 6.75" X 13.5" ACRYLIC BACKING.  FLAME
       RESISTANCE MEETS CALIF. 117, SEC. E
       NFPA 260-989, UFAC CLASS 1, BREAKING
       STRENGTH EXCEEDS 50 LBS. TEAR RESISTANCE
       EXCEEDS 6 LBS MINIMUM.
 
       MFR:________________PATTERN:____________
       CONE JACQUARDS     LAREDO
       ALL COLORS
 
 00007 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-085997                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, UPHOLSTERY, CONTENTS 63% POLY-
       ESTER, 37% OLEFIN. WIDTH 54", WEIGHT
       10:14 OZ PER LINEAR YARD. ACRYLIC BACK-
       ING, FLAME RESISTANCE MEETS CALIF. 117,
       SEC. E. BREAKING STRENGTH EXCEEDS 50
       LBS. TEAR RESISTANCE EXCEEDS 6 LBS.
 
       MFR:__________________PATTERN:__________
       CONE JACQUARDS    ENIGMA
       ALL COLOR
 
 00008 COMMODITY CODE: 265-46-080743                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       VINYL, UPHOLSTERY 54" W, 100% POLY-
       CARBONATE/COAGULATED POLYURETHANE,
       POLY/COTTON NAP SATEEN BACKING.  WEIGHT
       18 OZ. PER LINEAR YARD.  FLAMMABILITY:
       CALIFORNIA BULLETIN 117-SEC. E, BIFMA
       CLASS 1, UFAC CLASS 1.
 
       MFR:_________________PATTERN:___________
       OMNOVA, ELAN
 
 00009 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-086001                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, UPHOLSTERY, CONTENT 58% COTTON
       42% POLYESTER. WEIGHT 12.4 OZ PER LINEAR
       YD, WIDTH 54". BREAK STRENGTH EXCEEDS 50
       LBS. TEAR RESISTANCE EXCEEDS 6 LBS. FIRE
       RETARDANCY MEETS CALIF. 117, SEC. E.
 
 
 
 
            PAGE TOTAL                                                            ______________
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       MFR:_________________PATTERN:___________
       CONE JACQUARDS, VALIANT
       ALL COLORS
 
 00010 COMMODITY CODE: 265-46-080744                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       VINYL, UPHOLSTERY 54" W, 100% POLY-
       URETHANE, POLY/COTTON BACKING.
       FLAMMABILITY: CALIFORNIA TECH BULLETIN
       117-SEC. E, BIFMA CLASS I, UFAC CLASS I.
 
       MFR:_________________PATTERN:___________
       UNIROYAL ROYALTY MAJESTIC
       ALL COLORS
 
 00011 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-086010                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, VERTICAL SURFACE FIBER 100%
       POLYOLEFIN, WEIGHT 12 OZ PER LINEAR YD.
       WIDTH 66", LIGHT FASTNESS 60 HRS. CLASS
       5 AATCC TEST METHOD 16A, COLOR FASTNESS
       WET CLASS 5, DRY CLASS 5, FLAME
       RESISTANCE CALIF. 117, SEC. E, ASTM E84,
       CLASS A.
 
       MFR:_________________PATTERN:___________
       ABSECON MILLS   SONATA
       ALL COLORS
 
 00012 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-086011                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, VERTICAL SURFACE 100% POLYOLEFIN
       WEIGHT 12 OZ PER LINEAR YD, WIDTH 66"
       LIGHT FASTNESS 60 HOURS, CLASS 5, AATCC
       TEST METHOD 16A, COLOR FASTNESS, WET
       CLASS 5, DRY CLASS 5, FLAME RESISTANCE
       MEETS CALIF. 117, SEC. E, ASTM E84
 
       MFR:________________PATTERN:____________
       ABSECON MILLS   ARIA
       ALL COLORS
 
 00013 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-086013                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, VERTICAL SURFACE 100% POLYESTER
       WEIGHT 7.7 OZ PER LINEAR YD, WIDTH 66"
       BREAK STRENGTH WARP 100 LBS, FILL 68 LBS
       TEAR RESISTANCE, WARP 22 LBS, FILL 38
       LBS. FLAME RESISTANCE MEETS CALIF. 117,
       SEC. E, UFAC, CLASS 1, ASTM E-84 CLASS 1
 
       MFR:_________________PATTERN:___________
       GUILFORD OF ME  TREK
       ALL COLORS
 
 00014 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-086015                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, VERTICAL SURFACE CONTENTS 100%
       POLYESTER, WEAVE JACQUARD CONSTRUCTION
       ENDS. 131+2 PICKS, 54+2 YARN, 1 PLY
       FILAMENT & 2 PLY SPUN. WEIGHT 15 OZ PER
       LINEAR YD, WIDTH 66", TENSILE STRENGTH
       WARP 160 LBS, FILL 140 LBS, TEARING
       STRENGTH WARP 15 LBS FILL 15 LBS
       FLAMMABILITY CALIF. 117, SEC. E CS191-53
 
       MFR:________________PATTERN:____________
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       VICTOR      RENAISSANCE - SYMPHONY
       ALL COLORS
 
 00015 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-086016                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, VERTICAL SURFACE, CONTENT 67%
       POLYESTER, 33% ACRYLIC, WEIGHT 11.8 OZ
       PER LINEAR YARD, WIDTH 66", FLAME
       RETARDANCY MEETS CALIF. 117 SEC.E, UFAC
       CLASS I, CS191-53 CLASS I, BREAK
       STRENGTH, ASTM-D-4034, WARP 1,000 LBS,
       FILL 71 LBS.
 
       MFR:_________________PATTERN:___________
       GUILFORD OF ME    GILLETTE
       ALL COLORS
 
 00016 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-086017                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, VERTICAL SURFACE, CONTENT 100%
       POLYESTER, WEAVE, JACQUARD CONSTRUCTION
       ENDS: 131+/- 2, PICKS: 43+/- 2, YARN 1
       PLY FILAMENT AND 2 PLY SPUN, WEIGHT 13
       OZ PER LINEAR YARD, WIDTH 66", TENSILE
       STRENGTH WARP 160 LBS, FILL 115 LBS,
       TEARING STRENGTH WARP 20 LBS, FILL 20
       LBS, FLAMMABILITY CALIF. 117 SEC. E
       CS191-53
 
       MFR:_________________PATTERN:___________
       VICTOR INNOVATEX       LONGPORT
 
 00017 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-086018                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC VERTICAL SURFACE, CONTENT 100%
       POLYESTER, WEIGHT 7.7 OZ, LINEAR YD
       WIDTH 66", FLAME RETARDANCY CALIF. 117
       SEC. E, UFAC CLASS I, ASTM E-84 CLASS I,
       BREAK STRENGTH WARP 100 LBS, FILL 68 LBS
       TEAR RESISTANCE WARP 22 LBS, FILL 38 LBS
 
       MFR:_________________PATTERN:___________
       VALDESE WEAVERS     ALDEN/AVERY
       ALL COLORS
 
 00018 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-086019                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC VERTICAL SURFACE, CONTENT 70%
       POLYOLEFIN, 30% POLYESTER, WEIGHT 10 OZ
       PER LINEAR YD, WIDTH 66", LIGHT FASTNESS
       60 HOURS CLASS 5 AATCC TEST, COLOR FAST-
       NESS WET CLASS 5, DRY CLASS 5, FLAME
       RESISTANCE MEETS CALIF. 117, SEC. E.
 
       MFR:_________________PATTERN:___________
       GUILFORD OF ME       FOLIAGE
       ALL COLORS
 
 00019 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-086020                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC VERTICAL SURFACE, CONTENT 100%
       POLYESTER, WEIGHT 20 +/- OZ PER LINEAR
       YD, WIDTH 66", FLAME RETARDANCY, MEETS
       CALIF. 117, SEC. E, UFAC CLASS I, ASTM
       E-84 CLASS I, BREAK STRENGTH WARP 100
       LBS, FILL 68 LBS
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       MFR:_________________PATTERN:___________
       GULLIFORD OF ME    BERWICK II
       ALL COLORS
 
 00020 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-086021                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC VERTICAL SURFACE, FIBER 100%
       POLYOLEFIN, WEIGHT 12.5 OZ PER LINEAR
       YD, WIDTH 66", LIGHT FASTNESS 60 HOURS
       CLASS 5 AATCC TEST METHOD 16A, COLOR
       FASTNESS WET CLASS 5, DRY CLASS 5, FLAME
       RESISTANCE, CALIF. 117, SEC. E, ASTM E84
       CLASS A.
 
       MFR:_________________PATTERN:___________
       GUILFORD OF ME       KENYON
       ALL COLORS
 
 00021 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-086022                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, UPHOLSTERY, CONTENT 58% COTTON,
       42% POLYESTER, STANDARD WIDTH 54",
       WEIGHT 12.4 OZ PER LINEAR YD, ACRYLIC
       BACKING, FLAME RESISTANCE MEETS CALIF.
       117, SEC. E, NFPA 260-1989, UFAC CLASS
       1, BREAKING STRENGTH EXCEEDS 50 LBS,
       MINIMUM TEAR RESISTANCE EXCEEDS 6 LBS
 
       MFR:_________________PATTERN:___________
       CONE JACQUARDS      GLAMOUR
       ALL COLORS
 
 00022 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-086030                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, UPHOLSTERY, CONTENTS 53%
       POLYESTER / 47% POLYOLEFIN, STANDARD
       WIDTH 54", WEIGHT 11.7 OZ PER LINEAR
       YARD. ACRYLIC BACKING.  FLAME RESISTANCE
       MEETS CALIF. 117, SEC E, CS-191-53 CLASS
 
       MFR:________________PATTERN:____________
       ABSECON MILLS           TAFFETA
 
 00023 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-086031                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, UPHOLSTERY, CONTENTS 100%
       POLYOLEFIN, STANDARD WIDTH 54", WEIGH
       9.5 OZ PER LINEAR YARD, ACRYLIC BACKING.
       FLAME RESISTANCE MEETS CALIF. 117, SEC
       E, CS 191-53 CLASS
 
       MFR:________________PATTERN:____________
       ABSECON MILLS            CHANNEL
 
 00024 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-088847                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, UPHOLSTERY, CONTENTS 100%
       POLYOLEFIN, STANDARD WIDTH 54", WEIGH
       9.0 OZ PER LINEAR YARD, ACRYLIC BACKING.
       FLAME RESISTANCE MEETS CALIF. 117, SEC
       E, CS 191-53 CLASS
 
       MFR:________________PATTERN:____________
       ABSECON MILLS        QUARTET
 
 00025 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-088848                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, UPHOLSTERY, CONTENTS 50%
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       POLYESTER / 50% POLYOLEFIN, STANDARD
       WIDTH 54", WEIGHT 14 OZ PER LINEAR YARD,
       ACRYLIC BACKING.  REPEAT 3-7/16"
       HORIZONTAL X 3-1/8" VERTICAL.  FLAME
       RESISTANCE MEETS CALIF. 117, SEC E, CS
       191-53 CLASS
 
       MFR:_______________PATTERN:_____________
       ABSECON MILLS        DELANO
 
 00026 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-088849                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, UPHOLSTERY, CONTENTS 100%
       POLYOLEFIN, STANDARD WIDTH 54", ACRYLIC
       BACKING.  FLAME RESISTANCE MEETS CALIF.
       117, SEC E, CS 191-53 CLASS 1.
 
       MFR:________________PATTERN:____________
       ABSECON MILLS         ENSEMBLE
 
 00027 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-088850                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, UPHOLSTERY, CONTENTS 100%
       POLYOLEFIN, STANDARD WIDTH 54", WEIGHT
       11.5 OZ PER LINEAR YARY.  ACRYLIC
       BACKING.  REPEAT 1/4" HORIZONTAL X 1/2"
       VERTICAL.  FLAME RESISTANCE MEETS CALIF.
       117, SEC E, CS 191-53 CLASS 1.
 
       MFR:________________PATTERN:____________
       ABSECON MILLS         PRIMARY
 
 00028 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-088851                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, UPHOLSTERY, CONTENTS MARQUESA
       LANA, STANDARD WIDTH 54", WEIGHT 16.0
       OZ PER LINEAR YARD.  ACRYLIC BACKING.
       FLAME RESISTANCE MEETS CALIF. 117, SEC
       E, CS 191-53 CLASS 1.
 
       MFR:________________PATTERN:____________
       ABSECON MILLS           SHERPA/SHIRE
 
 00029 COMMODITY CODE: 265-46-088852                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       VINYL, UPHOLSTERY, 54"W, 30 OZ, 100%
       VIRGIN VINYL, HIGH LOFT KNIT (100%
       POLYESTER) BACKING.  FLAMMABILITY:
       CALIFORNIA BULLETIN 117 SEC E, BIFMA
       CLASS A, UFAC, CLASS 1.
 
       MFR:________________PATTERN:____________
       MORBERN USA            HTDE
 
 00030 COMMODITY CODE: 265-46-088853                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       VINYL, UPHOLSTERY, 54"W, 27 OZ, 100%
       VIRGIN VINYL, SOFT HI-LOFT BACKING,
       MILDEW RESISTANT, FLAMMABILITY:
       CALIFORNIA BULLETIN 117 SEC E, BIFMA
       CLASS A, UFAC CLASS 1.
 
       MFR:________________PATTERN:____________
       SPRADLING INT'L       WHISPER
 
 00031 COMMODITY CODE: 265-46-088854                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       VINYL, UPHOLSTERY, 54"W, 100% VIRGIN
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       VINYL, POLY/COTTON BACKING,
       FLAMMABILITY:  CALIFORNIA BULLETIN 117
       SEC E, BIFMA CLASS A, UFAC CLASS 1.
 
       MFR:________________PATTERN:____________
       UNIROYAL             ENGLISH PUB
 
 00032 COMMODITY CODE: 265-46-088855                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       VINYL, UPHOLSTERY, 54"W, 100% VIRGIN
       VINYL, 36 OZ, POLY/COTTON BACKING,
       FLAMMABILITY:  CALIFORNIA BULLETIN 117
       SEC E, BIFMA CLASS A, UFAC CLASS 1.
 
       MFR:________________PATTERN:____________
       SPRADLING INT'L        PATRIOT PLUS
 
 00033 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-088856                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, UPHOLSTERY, VALUE COORDINATES
       COLLECTION, 52% NYLON & 48% POLYESTER,
       MINIMUM 9 OZ PER LINEAR YARD, 54" WIDE.
       SURFACE ABRASION:  EXCEEDS 108,000
       DOUBLE RUBS
       REPEAT:  8"H & 5"V
       TENSILE STRENGTH:  WARP 170 LBS, FILL
       200 LBS
       LIGHT-FASTNESS:  EXCEEDS 40 HRS
       FLAMMABILITY:  PASSES THE FOLLOWING
       CAL. 117-E, UFAC, BIFMA, AND NFPA 260
       CLEANING CODE:  WS
       STAIN PROTECTOR:  DUPONT TEFLON
 
       MFR:_________________PATTERN:___________
       IF6   CELEBRATION
       ALL COLORS
       COLOR:________________________
 
 
 00034 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-088858                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, UPHOLSTERY, VALUE COORDINATES
       COLLECTION, 60% POLYESTER & 40% OLEFIN,
       MINIMUM 10.3 OZ / LINEAR YARD, 54" WIDE.
       SURFACE ABRASION:  EXCEEDS 100,000
       DOUBLE RUBS
       REPEAT:  7.5"H & 15"V NON-MATCHING
       TENSILE STRENGTH:  WARP 222 LBS, FILL
       225 LBS
       LIGHT-FASTNESS:  EXCEEDS 40 HRS
       FLAMMABILITY:  PASSES THE FOLLOWING
       CAL. 117-E, UFAC, BIFMA, AND NFPA 260
       CLEANING CODE:  WS
       STAIN PROTECTOR:  DUPONT TEFLON
 
       MFR:_________________PATTERN:___________
       IF6 CLEMATIC
       ALL COLORS
 
 
 00035 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-088859                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, UPHOLSTERY, VALUE COORDINATES
       COLLECTION, 2% NYLON & 48% POLYESTER,
       MINIMUM 9 OZ / LINEAR YARD, 54" WIDE.
       SURFACE ABRASION:  EXCEEDS 159,000
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       DOUBLE RUBS
       REPEAT:  2"H & 2"V
       TENSILE STRENGTH:  WARP 187 LBS, FILL
       98 LBS
       LIGHT-FASTNESS:  EXCEEDS 40 HRS
       FLAMMABILITY:  PASSES THE FOLLOWING
       CAL. 117-E, UFAC, BIFMA, AND NFPA 260
       CLEANING CODE:  WS
       STAIN PROTECTOR:  DUPONT TEFLON
 
       MFR:_________________PATTERN:___________
       IF6 COMPANION
 
 
 00036 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-088860                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, UPHOLSTERY, VALUE COORDINATES
       COLLECTION, 100% POLYESTER MINIMUM 13.75
       OZ / LINEAR YARD, 54" WIDE.
       SURFACE ABRASION:  EXCEEDS 1,000,000
       DOUBLE RUBS
       REPEAT:  NONE
       TENSILE STRENGTH:  WARP 368 LBS, FILL
       339 LBS
       LIGHT-FASTNESS:  EXCEEDS 60 HRS
       FLAMMABILITY:  PASSES THE FOLLOWING
       CAL. 117-E, UFAC, BIFMA, AND NFPA 260
       CLEANING CODE:  WS
       STAIN PROTECTOR:  DUPONT TEFLON
       GROUP 2 - MAINSTREAM COLLECTION
 
       MFR:________________PATTERN:____________
       IF6 FOUNDATION 10
       ALL COLORS
 
 
 00037 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-088861                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, UPHOLSTERY, MAINSTREAM
       COLLECTION, 100% INFINITY NYLON, MINIMUM
       11.2 OZ / LINEAR YARD, 54" WIDE.
       SURFACE ABRASION:  EXCEEDS 765,000
       DOUBLE RUBS
       REPEAT:  NONE
       TENSILE STRENGTH:  WARP 210 LBS, FILL
       160 LBS
       LIGHT-FASTNESS:  EXCEEDS 200 HRS
       FLAMMABILITY:  PASSES THE FOLLOWING
       CAL. 117-E, UFAC, BIFMA, AND NFPA 260
       CLEANING CODE:  WS
 
       MFR:________________PATTERN:____________
       IF6   DECADE CREPE
       ALL COLORS:
 
 
 00038 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-088862                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, UPHOLSTERY, MAINSTREAM
       COLLECTION, 100% FR POLYPROPYLENE,
       MINIMUM 11 OZ / LINEAR YARD, 54" WIDE.
       SURFACE ABRASION:  EXCEEDS 63,000
       DOUBLE RUBS
       REPEAT:  13.5"H & 5"V
       TENSILE STRENGTH:  WARP 112 LBS, FILL
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       161 LBS
       LIGHT-FASTNESS:  EXCEEDS 40 HRS
       FLAMMABILITY:  PASSES THE FOLLOWING
       CAL. 117-E, UFAC, BIFMA, AND NFPA 260
       CLEANING CODE:  W
 
       MFR:________________PATTERN:____________
       MAYER MONSOON FR (FIRE RETARDANT)
 
       COLOR:_______________________
       COLORS:
       218-001 BURGUNDY WINE SWIRL; 218-002
       WINDED WHEAT; 218-003 SWAMP MOSS;
       218-003 DEEP SEA; 218-006 THUNDER;
       218-007 DESERT STORM; 218-008 STORMY
       SKY; 218-009 ORANGE CRUSH; 218-013
       TROPICAL PUNCH
 
 00039 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-088868                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, VERTICAL SURFACE 100% POLYESTER
       WEIGHT 9.1 OZ / LINEAR YARD, 66" WIDE.
       BREAK STRENGTH WARP 100 LB, FILL 68 LB
       TEAR RESISTANCE, WARP 22 LB, FILL 38 LB
       FAMMABILITY:  MEETS CALIF. 117, SECTION
       E, UFAC, CLASS 1, ASTM E-84 CLASS 1
 
       MFR:_________________PATTERN:___________
       VALDESE WEAVERS     RUTGERS/RANGER
       ALL COLORS
 
 00040 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-088869                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, VERTICAL SURFACE 100% POLYESTER
       WEIGHT 9.1 OZ / LINEAR YARD, 66" WIDE.
       BREAK STRENGTH WARP 135 LB, FILL 35 LB
       TEAR RESISTANCE, WARP 26 LB, FILL 37 LB
       FAMMABILITY:  MEETS CALIF. 117, SECTION
       E, UFAC, CLASS 1, ASTM E-84 CLASS 1
 
       MFR:_________________PATTERN:__________
       VALDESE WEAVERS    SWANSON/SHEPERD
       ALL COLORS
 
 00041 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-085993                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, UPHOLSTERY, PURETSIMPLE
       COLLECTION, 100% POLYESTER
       MINIMUM 11.5 OZ / LINEAR YARD, 54" WIDE
       SURFACE ABRASION:  90,000 DOUBLE RUBS
       REPEAT:  .50"H & 1"V
       TENSILE STRENGTH: WARP 60 LBS, FILL
       43 LBS
       LIGHT-FASTNESS:  EXCEEDS 60 HRS, CLASS 5
       FLAMMABILITY:  PASSES THE FOLLOWING
       CAL. 117-E, UFAC, BIFMA, AND NFPA 200189
       CLASS 1
       CLEANING CODE: WS
       STAIN PROTECTOR:  DUPONT TEFLON
 
       MFR:_________________PATTERN:___________
       ABSECON MILLS         FOUNDATION
 
 
 00042 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-091776                1    YD    ______________     ______________
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       FABRIC, UPHOLSTERY 100% POLYESTER; 54"
       WIDTH; ACRYLIC BACKING; SOIL AND STAIN
       RESISTANT; FLAMMABILITY SPECS CA
       BULLETIN 117 SEC. E9 UFAC CLASS 1, NFPA
       260; ABRASION RATING 50,000 D.R.; COLOR-
       FASTNESS TO LIGHT RATING AATCC16A, CLASS
       5; HOURS EXPOSED TO LIGHT 40; CROCKING,
       DRY 4.5, WET 4.5; PILLING RESISTANCE 5.0
       SEAM SLIPPAGE 59.0, FILL 84.0, TENSILE
       STRENGTH WARP 286.0 FILL 330.0; REPEAT
       LENGTH 0.7500 INCHES WIDTH 0.7500;
       CLEANING CODE WS WATER-BASED CLEANING
       AGENTS OR FOAM; WEIGHT PER LIN. YD. 0.58
       LB; THREAD COUNT PICKS 46, ENDS 164; DYE
       YARN.
 
       BRAND:______________PATTERN:____________
       MOMENTUM INTERVAL
       ALL COLORS
 
 00043 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-088866                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, UPHOLSTERY, NOT LISTED ON
       STATE CONTRACT
       ALL COLORS
       PRICING:
       RATE:_______________ DISCOUNT:__________
       WIDTH:_______
 
       MFR:_________________PATTERN:___________
 
       VENDORS WISHING TO BID A PRODUCT/FABRIC
       THAT IS NOT LISTED ON THE CONTRACT
       SHOULD LIST BRAND AND PATTERN AND
       PERCENT OFF CATALOG PRICE.  CATALOG
       SHOULD BE SUBMITTED WITH YOUR BID.
 
 00044 COMMODITY CODE: 265-46-088867                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       VINYL, UPHOLSTERY, NOT LISTED ON
       STATE CONTRACT
       ALL COLORS
       PRICING:
       RATE:_______________ DISCOUNT:__________
       WIDTH:_______
 
       MFR:_________________PATTERN:___________
 
       VENDORS WISHING TO BID PRODUCT/FABRIC
       NOT LISTED ON CONTRACT SHOULD LIST
       THAT PRODUCT HERE WITH THE BRAND AND
       PATTERN AS WELL AS THE PERCENT OFF
       CATALOG PRICE.  CATALOG SHOULD BE
       SUBMITTED WITH YOUR BID.
 
 00045 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-091775                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, UPHOLSTERY 100% POLYESTER; 54"
       WIDTH; SOIL AND STAIN RESISTANT;
       FLAMMABILITY SPECS CA BULLETIN 117 SEC.
       E, UFAC CLASS 1, ASTM E84: ABRASION
       RATING 102,000 D.R.; COLORFASTNESS TO
       LIGHT RATING AATCC16A, CLASS 4; HOURS
       EXPOSED TO LIGHT 40; CROCKING DRY 5.0,
       WET 5.0; PILLING RESISTANCE 5.0; SEAM
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       SLIPPAGE WARP 31.8 FILL 35.5; TENSILE
       STRENGTH WARP 237.0 FILL 284.0; REPEAT
       LENGTH 0.1250 INCHES WIDTH 0.6250 INCHES
       CLEANING CODE WS WATER-BASED CLEANING
       AGENTS OR FOAM. WEIGHT PER LIN. YD. 0.72
       LB; THREAD COUNT PICKS 57, ENDS 174; DYE
       YARN.
 
       BRAND:______________PATTERN:____________
       MOMENTUM          GAUGE
       ALL COLORS
 
 00046 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-091776                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, UPHOLSTERY 100% POLYESTER; 54"
       WIDTH; ACRYLIC BACKING; SOIL AND STAIN
       RESISTANT; FLAMMABILITY SPECS CA
       BULLETIN 117 SEC. E9 UFAC CLASS 1, NFPA
       260; ABRASION RATING 50,000 D.R.; COLOR-
       FASTNESS TO LIGHT RATING AATCC16A, CLASS
       5; HOURS EXPOSED TO LIGHT 40; CROCKING,
       DRY 4.5, WET 4.5; PILLING RESISTANCE 5.0
       SEAM SLIPPAGE 59.0, FILL 84.0, TENSILE
       STRENGTH WARP 286.0 FILL 330.0; REPEAT
       LENGTH 0.7500 INCHES WIDTH 0.7500;
       CLEANING CODE WS WATER-BASED CLEANING
       AGENTS OR FOAM; WEIGHT PER LIN. YD. 0.58
       LB; THREAD COUNT PICKS 46, ENDS 164; DYE
       YARN.
 
       BRAND:______________PATTERN:____________
       MOMENTUM INTERVAL
       ALL COLORS
 
 00047 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-091777                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, UPHOLSTERY 53% POST INDUSTRIAL
       RECYCLED POLYESTER, 47% OLEFIN; WIDTH
       54.00; LATEX BACKING; FINISH TEFLON;
       FLAMMABILITY SPECS CA BULLETIN 117 SEC.
       E, UFAC CLASS 1; ABRASION RATING 50,000
       D.R.; COLORFASTNESS TO LIGHT RATING 60;
       CROCKING DRY 4.0, WET 4.0; PILLING
       RESISTANCE 4.0; SEAM SLIPPAGE WARP 50.0,
       FILL 48.0; TENSILE STRENGTH WARP 185.0,
       FILL 180.0; REPEAT LENGTH 6.75" WIDTH
       6.75"; PATTERN DIRECTIONAL; CLEANING
       CODE W WATER BASED FOAM, VACUUM, BRUSHED
       WEIGHT PER LIN. TD. 0.64 LB; THREAD
       COUNT PICKS 71, ENDS 132; DYE YARN.
 
       BRAND:______________PATTERN:____________
       MOMENTUM      SAVEY
       ALL COLORS
 
 00048 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-091781                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, UPHOLSTERY 100% POLYESTER; WIDTH
       54.0 INCHES; LATEX BACKING; FINISH SOIL
       AND STAIN RESISTANT; FLAMMABILITY SPECS
       CA BULLETIN 117 SEC. E, UFAC CLASS 1,
       NFPA 260; ABRATION RATING 100,000 D.R.;
       COLORFASTNESS TO LIGHT RATING AATCC16A,
       CLASS 5; HOURS EXPOSED TO LIGHT 40;
       CROCKING DRY 4.5, WET 4.5; PILLING
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       RESISTANCE 5.0; SEAM SLIPPAGE WARP 33.5,
       FILL 34.3; TENSILE STRENGTH WARP 232.0,
       FILL 328.0; REPEAT LENGTH 1.25 INCHES,
       WIDTH 1.25 INCHES; PATTERN DIRECTIONAL;
       CLEANING CODE WS WATER-BASED CLEANING
       AGENTS OR FOAM; WEIGHT PER LIN. YD. 0.70
       LB; THREAD COUNT PICKS 74, ENDS 132; DYE
       YARD.
 
       BRAND:______________PATTERN:____________
       MOMEMTUM         TANGENT
       ALL COLORS
 
 00049 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-091782                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, UPHOLSTERY 100% POLYESTER; WIDTH
       54.0 INCHES; ACRYLIC BACKING; FINISH
       SOIL AND STAIN RESISTANT; FLAMMABILITY
       SPECS CA BULLETIN 117 SEC. E, UFAC CLASS
       1, NFPA 260; ABRASION RATING 39,000 D.R.
       COLORFASTNESS TO LIGHT RATING AATCC16A,
       CLASS 5; HOURS EXPOSED TO LIGHT 40;
       CROCKING DRY 4.5, WET 4.5; PILLING
       RESISTANCE 5.0; SEAM SLIPPAGE WARP 39.0,
       FILL 144.0; REPEAT LENGTH 1.000 INCHES,
       WIDTH 1.000; CLEANING CODE WS WATER-
       BASED CLEANING AGENTS OR FOAM; WEIGHT
       PER LIN. YD. 0.81 LB; THREAD COUNT PICKS
       50, ENDS 172; DYE YARN,
 
       BRAND:_______________PATTERN:___________
       MOMENTUM          PIVOTT
       ALL COLORS
 
 00050 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-091778                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, UPHOLSTERY 100% POLYESTER; 56.00
       WIDTH; LATEX BACKING; TEFLON FINISH;
       FLAMMABILITY SPECS CA BULLETIN 117, SEC.
       E, UFAC CLASS 1, NFPA 260; ABRASION
       RATING 100,000 D.R.; COLORFASTNESS TO
       LIGHT RATING AATCC16A, CLASS 4; HOURS
       EXPOSED TO LIGHT 40; CROCKING DRY 4.0,
       WET 4.0; PILLING RESISTANCE 4.0; SEAM
       SLIPPAGE WARP 55.0, FILL 55.0; TENSILE
       STRENGTH WARP 60.0, FILL 70.0; CLEANING
       CODE W WATER BASED FOAM, VACUUM, BRUSH;
       WEIGHT PER LIN. YD. 0.79 LB; THREAD
       COUNT PICKS 43, ENDS 46; DYE PIECE.
 
       BRAND:______________PATTERN:____________
       MOMEMTUM          ACE
       ALL COLORS
 
 00051 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-091779                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, UPHOLSTERY 100% POLYESTER; 56.00
       WIDTH; LATEX BACKING; TEFLON FINISH,
       FLAMMABILITY SPECS CA BULLETIN 117 SEC.
       E, UFAC CLASS 1, NFPA 260; ABRASION
       RATING 100,000 D.R.; COLORFASTNESS TO
       LIGHT RATING AATCC16A, CLASS 4; HOURS
       EXPOSED TO LIGHT 40; CROCKING DRY 4.0,
       WET 4.0; PILLING RESISTANCE 4.0; SEAM
       SLIPPAGE WARP 60.0, FILL 71.0; TENSILE
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       STRENGTH WARP 72.00, FILL 62.0; CLEANING
       CODE W WATERBASED FOAM, VACUUM, BRUSH;
       WEIGHT PER LIN. YD. 0.79 LB; THREAD
       COUNT PICKS 43, ENDS 46.  DYE PIECE.
 
       BRAND:______________PATTERN:____________
       MOMEMTUM         RATIO
       ALL COLORS
 
 00052 COMMODITY CODE: 265-44-091780                1    YD    ______________     ______________
       FABRIC, UPHOLSTERY 100% POLYESTER; 56.00
       WIDTH; LATEX BACKING; FINISH SOIL AND
       STAIN RESISTANT; FLAMMABILITY SPECS CA
       BULLETIN 117 SEC. E, UFAC CLASS 1, NFPA
       620; ABRASION RATING 405,000 D.R.;
       COLORFASTNESS TO LIGHT RATING AATCC16A,
       CLASS 4; HOURS EXPOSED TO LIGHT 40;
       CROCKING DRY 4.0, WET 3.0; PILLING
       RESISTANCE 4.0; SEAM SLIPAGE WARP 36.0,
       FILL 38.0; TENSILE STRENGTH WARP 366.0,
       FILL 335.0; REPEAT LENGTH 0.1250, WIDTH
       0.1250; CLEANING CODE W WATER BASED FOAM
       VACUUM, BRUSH; WEIGHT PER LIN. YD. 0.77
       LB; THREAD COUNT PICKS 38, ENDS 45; DYE
       PIECE.
 
       BRAND:______________PATTERN:____________
       MOMENTUM       CINCH
       ALL COLORS
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