



INVITATION TO BID NO: 10-X-2215350

STATE OF ALABAMA
DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE
DIVISION OF PURCHASING

REQ. AGENCY : 012001
ALA DEPT OF TRANSPORTATION
AGENCY REQ. NO. :
T-NUMBER : TA761
DATE ISSUED : 12/17/09
VENDOR NO. :
VENDOR PHONE NO. :
SNAP REQ. NO. : 1429017
BUYER NAME : SUSAN JANA

INVITATION TO BID

FOR: EROSION CONTROL PRODUCTS

BUYER PHONE NO. : (334) 242-7173-
PURCHASING PHONE NO: (334) 242-7250

BID MUST BE RECEIVED BEFORE:
DATE: 01/13/10 TIME: 5:00 PM

BIDS WILL BE PUBLICLY OPENED:
DATE: 01/14/10 TIME: 10:00 AM

TO BE COMPLETED BY VENDOR

INFORMATION IN THIS SECTION SHOULD BE PROVIDED, AS APPROPRIATE. BID RESPONSE MUST BE IN INK OR TYPED WITH ORIGINAL SIGNATURE AND NOTARIZATION.

1. DELIVERY: CAN BE MADE _____ DAYS OR _____ WEEKS AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDER
2. TERMS: _____(DISCOUNTS ARE TAKEN WITHOUT REGARD TO DATE OF PAYMENT.)
3. PRICE VALID FOR ACCEPTANCE WITHIN _____ DAYS.
4. VENDOR QUOTATION REFERENCE NUMBER, IF ANY: _____
(THIS NUMBER WILL APPEAR ON THE PURCHASE ORDER.)
5. E-MAIL ADDRESS: _____
INTERNET WEBSITE: _____
6. GENERAL CONTRACTOR'S LICENSE NO: _____
TYPE OF G.C. LICENSE: _____

***** IMPORTANT NOTE: *****

BIDDERS MUST COMPLY WITH ALL "BID RESPONSE INSTRUCTIONS" ON PAGE 2, TO INCLUDE ITEM 7 - COPY REQUIREMENT.

RETURN INVITATION TO BID:

US MAIL

COURIER

STATE OF ALABAMA
DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE
DIVISION OF PURCHASING
P O BOX 302620
MONTGOMERY, AL 36130-2620

STATE OF ALABAMA
DIVISION OF PURCHASING
RSA UNION BUILDING
100 N. UNION ST., SUITE 192
MONTGOMERY, AL 36104

SIGNATURE AND NOTARIZATION REQUIRED

I HAVE READ THE ENTIRE BID AND AGREE TO FURNISH EACH ITEM OFFERED AT THE PRICE QUOTED. I HERBY AFFIRM I HAVE NOT BEEN IN ANY AGREEMENT OR COLLUSION AMONG BIDDERS IN RESTRAINT OF FREEDOM OF COMPETITION BY AGREEMENT TO BID AT A FIXED PRICE OR TO REFRAIN FROM BIDDING.

SWORN TO AND

FEIN OR SSN

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE (INK)

SUBSCRIBED BEFORE ME THIS

COMPANY NAME

TYPE/PRINT AUTHORIZED NAME

_____ DAY OF _____

MAIL ADDRESS

TITLE

NOTARY PUBLIC

CITY, STATE, ZIP

TOLL FREE NUMBER

TERM EXP: _____

PHONE INCLUDING AREA CODE

FAX NUMBER

STANDARD TERMS & CONDITIONS

VENDOR NAME :

VENDOR NUMBER: -
ITB NO. : 10-X-2215350 PAGE 2
OPEN DATE : 01/14/10 TIME: 10:00 AM
T-NUMBER : TA761
RETURN DATE: 01/13/10 TIME: 5:00 PM

INVITATION TO BID

AUTHORITY:

THE DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE CODE OF ADMINISTRATIVE PROCEDURE, CHAPTER 355-4-1 EFFECTIVE DECEMBER 20, 2001 IS INCORPORATED BY REFERENCE AND MADE A PART OF THIS DOCUMENT. TO RECEIVE A COPY CALL (334)242-7250, OR OUR WEBSITE WWW.PURCHASING.ALABAMA.GOV .

INFORMATION AND ASSISTANCE TO MINORITY BUSINESSES IN THE TECHNICAL COMPLETION OF REQUIRED FORMS MAY BE OBTAINED FROM THE OFFICE OF MINORITY BUSINESS ENTERPRISE, 1-800-447-4191.

BID (ITB) RESPONSE INSTRUCTIONS REV: 09/18/09

1. TO SUBMIT A RESPONSIVE BID, READ THESE INSTRUCTIONS, ALL TERMS, CONDITIONS AND SPECIFICATIONS.
2. BID ENVELOPES/PACKAGES/BOXES MUST BE IDENTIFIED ON FRONT, PREFERABLY LOWER LEFT CORNER AND BE VISIBLE WITH THE BID NUMBER AND OPENING DATE. EACH INDIVIDUAL BID (IDENTIFIED BY A UNIQUE BID NUMBER) MUST BE SUBMITTED IN A SEPARATE ENVELOPE. RESPONSES TO MULTIPLE BID NUMBERS SUBMITTED IN THE SAME ENVELOPE/COURIER PACKAGE, THAT ARE NOT IN SEPARATE ENVELOPES PROPERLY IDENTIFIED, WILL BE REJECTED. THE DIVISION OF PURCHASING DOES NOT ASSUME RESPONSIBILITY FOR LATE BIDS FOR ANY REASON INCLUDING THOSE DUE TO POSTAL, OR COURIER SERVICE. BID RESPONSES MUST BE IN THE DIVISION OF PURCHASING OFFICE PRIOR TO THE "RECEIVE DATE AND TIME" INDICATED ON THE BID.
3. BID RESPONSES (PAGE 1, PRICE SHEET AND ADDENDUMS (WHEN SIGNATURE IS REQUIRED)) MUST BE IN INK OR TYPED ON THIS DOCUMENT. OR EXACT FORMAT WITH SIGNATURES BEING HANDWRITTEN ORIGINALS IN INK (PERSON SIGNING BID, NOTARY, AND NOTARY EXPIRATION), OR THE BID WILL BE REJECTED. UNLESS INDICATED IN THE BID, ALL PRICE PAGES MUST BE COMPLETED AND RETURNED. IF AN ITEM IS NOT BEING BID, IDENTIFY IT AS NB (NO-BID). PAGES SHOULD BE SECURED. THE DIVISION OF PURCHASING DOES NOT ASSUME RESPONSIBILITY FOR MISSING PAGES. FAXED BID RESPONSES WILL NOT BE ACCEPTED.
4. THE UNIT PRICE ALWAYS GOVERNS REGARDLESS OF THE EXTENDED AMOUNT. A UNIT PRICE CHANGE ON A LINE MUST BE INITIALED BY THE PERSON SIGNING THE BID, OR THAT LINE WILL BE REJECTED. THIS INCLUDES A CROSS-OUT, STRIKE-OVER, INK-OVER, WHITE-OUT, ERASURE, OR ANY OTHER METHOD CHANGING THE PRICE.
5. A "NO BID" MUST BE RETURNED TO REMAIN ON A CLASS/SUBCLASS. RETURN PAGE 1 OR NOTIFICATION PAGE MARKED "NO-BID". IDENTIFY IT ON THE ENVELOPE AS A "NO-BID". FAILING TO RESPOND TO 3 ITB'S WITHIN THE SAME CLASS/SUBCLASS WILL AUTOMATICALLY PURGE THE VENDOR FROM THAT CLASS/SUBCLASS. RESPONDING WITH 6 "NO-BIDS" WITHIN THE SAME CLASS/SUBCLASS WILL AUTOMATICALLY PURGE THE VENDOR FROM THAT CLASS/SUBCLASS. A "NO-BID" RECEIVED LATE IS CONSIDERED A NO RESPONSE.
6. THE DIVISION OF PURCHASING IS NOT RESPONSIBLE FOR MISINTERPRETATION OF DATA FAXED FROM THIS OFFICE.
7. THE DIVISION OF PURCHASING REQUIRES AN ORIGINAL AND A MINIMUM OF ONE COMPLETE EXACT COPY (TO INCLUDE SIGNATURE AND NOTARY) OF THE INVITATION-TO-BID RESPONSE. THE ORIGINAL AND THE COPY SHOULD BE SUBMITTED TOGETHER AS A BID PACKAGE. FAILURE TO MARK RESPONSES AS "ORIGINAL" AND/OR "COPY" COULD RESULT IN THE ENTIRE BID RESPONSE BEING REJECTED.
8. AN IMPROPERLY SUBMITTED BID, LATE BID, OR BID THAT IS CANCELLED ON OR BEFORE THE OPENING DATE WILL BE HELD FOR 90 DAYS AND THEN DESTROYED. THE BID MUST BE RETRIEVED DURING REGULAR WORK HOURS, MONDAY - FRIDAY, EXCEPT STATE HOLIDAYS. AFTER THE BID IS DESTROYED, THE DIVISION OF PURCHASING ASSUMES NO RESPONSIBILITY FOR THE DOCUMENT.

DISQUALIFIED/CANCELLED BID

BIDS THAT ARE IMPROPERLY SUBMITTED OR RECEIVED LATE WILL BE A RESPONSE FOR RECORD, BUT WILL NOT BE RETURNED OR A NOTIFICATION MAILED.

THE FOLLOWING IS A PARTIAL LIST WHEREBY A BID RESPONSE WILL BE DISQUALIFIED:

- BID NUMBER NOT ON FACE OF ENVELOPE/COURIER PACKAGE/BOX
- RESPONSES TO MULTIPLE BID NUMBERS IN SAME ENVELOPE NOT PROPERLY IDENTIFIED
- BID RECEIVED LATE
- BID NOT SIGNED/NOT ORIGINAL SIGNATURE
- BID NOT NOTARIZED/NOT ORIGINAL SIGNATURE OF NOTARY AND/OR NO NOTARY EXPIRATION
- NOTARIZED OWN SIGNATURE
- REQUIRED INFORMATION NOT SUBMITTED WITH BID
- FAILURE TO SUBMIT THE ORIGINAL BID AND A COMPLETE EXACT COPY

CERTIFICATION PURSUANT TO ACT NO. 2006-557

ALABAMA LAW (SECTION 41-4-116, CODE OF ALABAMA 1975) PROVIDES THAT EVERY BID SUBMITTED AND CONTRACT EXECUTED SHALL CONTAIN A CERTIFICATION THAT THE VENDOR, CONTRACTOR, AND ALL OF ITS AFFILIATES THAT MAKE SALES FOR DELIVERY INTO ALABAMA OR LEASES FOR USE IN ALABAMA ARE REGISTERED, COLLECTING, AND REMITTING ALABAMA STATE AND LOCAL SALES, USE, AND/OR LEASE TAX ON ALL TAXABLE SALES AND LEASES INTO ALABAMA. BY SUBMITTING THIS BID, THE BIDDER IS HEARBY CERTIFYING THAT THEY ARE IN FULL COMPLIANCE WITH ACT NO. 2006-557, THEY ARE NOT BARRED FROM BIDDING OR ENTERING INTO A CONTRACT PURSUANT TO 41-4-116, AND ACKNOWLEDGES THAT THE AWARDING AUTHORITY MAY DECLARE THE CONTRACT VOID IF THE CERTIFICATION IS FALSE.

SPECIAL TERMS & CONDITIONS

VENDOR NAME :

VENDOR NUMBER: -
ITB NO. : 10-X-2215350
OPEN DATE : 01/14/10 TIME: 10:00 AM
T-NUMBER : TA761
RETURN DATE: 01/13/10 TIME: 5:00 PM

PAGE 3

INVITATION TO BID

INTENT TO AWARD

EFFECTIVE MAY 1, 2008, THE STATE OF ALABAMA - DIVISION OF PURCHASING WILL ISSUE AN 'INTENT TO AWARD' BEFORE A FINAL AWARD IS MADE. THE 'INTENT TO AWARD' WILL CONTINUE FOR A PERIOD OF FIVE (5) CALENDAR DAYS, AFTER WHICH A PURCHASE ORDER WILL BE PRODUCED. UPON FINAL AWARD, ALL RIGHTS TO PROTEST ARE FORFEITED. A DETAILED EXPLANATION OF THIS PROCESS MAY BE REVIEWED IN THE ALABAMA ADMINISTRATIVE CODE - CHAPTER 355-4-1(14).

ALTERNATE BID RESPONSE

UNLESS STATED ELSEWHERE IN THIS INVITATION-TO-BID (ITB) THE STATE OF ALABAMA WILL ACCEPT AND EVALUATE ALTERNATE BID SUBMITTALS ON ANY ITB'S. ALTERNATE BID RESPONSES WILL BE EVALUATED ACCORDING TO THE REQUIREMENTS AS ALL OTHER RESPONSES TO THIS ITB.

INTERNET WEBSITE LINK'S

INTERNET AND/OR WEBSITE LINKS WILL NOT BE ACCEPTED IN BID RESPONSES AS A MEANS TO SUPPLY ANY REQUIREMENTS STATED IN THIS ITB (INVITATION-TO-BID).

PRODUCT DELIVERY, RECEIVING AND ACCEPTANCE

IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE UNIVERSAL COMMERCE CODE (CODE OF ALABAMA, TITLE 7), AFTER DELIVERY, THE STATE OF ALABAMA HAS THE RIGHT TO INSPECT ALL PRODUCTS BEFORE ACCEPTING. THE STATE WILL INSPECT PRODUCTS IN A REASONABLE TIMEFRAME. SIGNATURE ON A DELIVERY DOCUMENT DOES NOT CONSTITUTE ACCEPTANCE BY THE STATE. THE STATE WILL ACCEPT PRODUCTS ONLY AFTER SATISFACTORY INSPECTION.

SALES TAX EXEMPTION

PURSUANT TO THE CODE OF ALABAMA, 1975, TITLE 40-23-4 (A) (11), THE STATE OF ALABAMA IS EXEMPT FROM PAYING SALES TAX. AN EXEMPTION LETTER WILL BE FURNISHED UPON REQUEST.

INVOICES

INQUIRIES CONCERNING PAYMENT AFTER INVOICES HAVE BEEN SUBMITTED ARE TO BE DIRECTED TO THE RECEIVING AGENCY, NOT THE DIVISION OF PURCHASING

BID RESPONSES AND BID RESULTS

UNEVALUATED BID RESPONSES (NOT BID RESULTS) ARE AVAILABLE ON OUR WEB SITE AT WWW.PURCHASING.ALABAMA.GOV. BID RESULTS WILL BE MADE AVAILABLE FOR REVIEW IN THE DIVISION OF PURCHASING OFFICE, BUT ONLY AFTER THE BID HAS BEEN AWARDED. WE DO NOT FAX OR MAIL COPIES OF BID RESULTS. IF A VENDOR WISHES TO REVIEW BID RESULTS IN OUR OFFICE, THEY SHOULD FAX THEIR REQUEST TO REVIEW THE BID TWO DAYS IN ADVANCE TO THE "BID REVIEW CLERK" AT (334) 242-4419. BE SURE TO REFERENCE THE BID NUMBER.

FOREIGN CORPORATION - CERTIFICATE OF AUTHORITY

ALABAMA LAW PROVIDES THAT A FOREIGN CORPORATION (AN OUT-OF-STATE COMPANY/FIRM) MAY NOT TRANSACT BUSINESS IN THE STATE OF ALABAMA UNTIL IT OBTAINS A CERTIFICATE OF AUTHORITY FROM THE SECRETARY OF STATE. SECTION 10-2B-15.01, CODE OF ALABAMA 1975. TO OBTAIN FORMS FOR A CERTIFICATE OF AUTHORITY, CONTACT THE SECRETARY OF STATE, CORPORATIONS DIVISION, (334) 242-5324. THE CERTIFICATE OF AUTHORITY DOES NOT KEEP THE VENDOR FROM SUBMITTING A BID.

BID IDENTIFICATION

REFERENCE PAGE 2, ITEM 2. DUE TO THE POSTAL SERVICE PUTTING BAR CODE LABELS ON ENVELOPES, IT CONCEALS THE BID NUMBER AND DATE IF THE VENDOR HAS WRITTEN THEM OTHER THAN THE LOWER LEFT CORNER, THEREFORE THE BID WOULD BE REJECTED FOR NOT BEING PROPERLY IDENTIFIED.

SPECIAL TERMS & CONDITIONS

VENDOR NAME :

VENDOR NUMBER: -
ITB NO. : 10-X-2215350
OPEN DATE : 01/14/10 TIME: 10:00 AM
T-NUMBER : TA761
RETURN DATE: 01/13/10 TIME: 5:00 PM

INVITATION TO BID

PURPOSE:
ESTABLISH AN AGENCY CONTRACT FOR THE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION FOR THE ITEMS LISTED ON THIS ITB. DOT WILL BE THE SOLE USER OF THIS CONTRACT.

AWARD:
AWARD WILL MAINLY BE LINE BY LINE TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER. LINES 04 - 08 MAY BE AWARDED AS A GROUP, TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE BIDDER, TO ENSURE COMPATABILITY.

ASSIGNMENT OF CONTRACT:
TO ASSIGN, SUBLET OR TRANSFER ANY CONTRACT RESULTING FROM THIS SOLICITATION, THE VENDOR'S WRITTEN REQUEST MUST BE APPROVED BY THE STATE PURCHASING DIRECTOR.

FREIGHT:
BID IS F.O.B. DESTINATION FOR ORDERS \$200.00 OR MORE. ORDERS LESS THAN \$200.00, VENDORS MAY PRE-PAY AND ADD FREIGHT.

THE AGENCY RESERVES THE RIGHT TO PICK UP MATERIALS FROM THE VENDOR'S DOCK, REGARDLESS OF THE DOLLAR AMOUNT OF THE ORDER, WITH NO FREIGHT.

CONTRACT PERIOD:
ESTABLISH A 12 MONTH CONTRACT WITH AN OPTION TO EXTEND FOR A SECOND, THIRD, FOURTH, AND FIFTH 12 MONTH PERIOD WITH THE SAME PRICING, TERMS AND CONDITIONS. THE SECOND, THIRD, FOURTH, OR FIFTH 12 MONTH PERIOD, IF AGREED BY BOTH PARTIES, WOULD BEGIN THE DAY AFTER THE FIRST, SECOND, THIRD, OR FOURTH 12 MONTH PERIOD EXPIRES. ANY SUCCESSIVE EXTENSION MUST HAVE WRITTEN APPROVAL OF BOTH THE STATE AND VENDOR NO LATER THAN 30 DAYS PRIOR TO EXPIRATION OF THE PREVIOUS 12 MONTH PERIOD.

ORDERING PROCESS:
PURCHASES WILL BE MADE BY CONTRACT RELEASE ORDERS AND OPEN-ENDED PURCHASE ORDERS THAT COVER ONE FISCAL YEAR.

MANUFACTURER/MODEL NUMBERS:
AT THE END OF EACH ITEM WHERE SPACES ARE MARKED "MFR" AND "MDL", VENDORS MUST INDICATE THE MANUFACTURER & ALL STOCK/MODEL NUMBERS NECESSARY TO COMPLETE EACH UNIT AS SPECIFIED.

THIS INFORMATION MUST BE COMPLETED, EVEN IF BIDDING THE RECOMMENDED MFR/MODEL. FAILURE TO COMPLETE THIS INFORMATION WILL RESULT IN BID REJECTION.

* SPECIAL NOTE: PRODUCTS BID FOR LINES 01 - 10 MUST BE ON THE ALDOT MATERIALS, SOURCES, & DEVICES WITH SPECIAL ACCEPTANCE REQUIREMENTS (MSDSAR).

DESCRIPTIVE LITERATURE:
THE BRANDS AND MODEL NUMBERS REFERENCED PROVIDE A LEVEL OF QUALITY, AND UNLESS OTHERWISE SPECIFIED, ARE NOT RESTRICTIVE. VENDORS BIDDING ALTERNATE ITEMS MUST PROVIDE COMPLETE DESCRIPTIVE/TECHNICAL LITERATURE WITH BOTH THE ORIGINAL AND REQUIRED COPY OF THE BID. REFERENCE TO A WEBSITE OR TO LITERATURE WITH A PREVIOUS BID WILL NOT SATISFY THIS REQUIREMENT.

FAILURE TO SUBMIT DESCRIPTIVE LITERATURE WITH THE ORIGINAL AND/OR REQUIRED COPY OF THE BID WILL RESULT IN LINE REJECTION.

PHYSICAL INSPECTION AND OPERATIONAL EVALUATION MAY ALSO BE REQUIRED WITHOUT COST OR OBLIGATION TO THE STATE OF ALABAMA.

* SPECIAL NOTE: THIS TERM AND CONDITION ONLY APPLIES TO LINES 11 - 14, AS THESE PRODUCTS ARE NOT LISTED ON THE APPROVED MSDSAR LIST LIKE LINES 01 - 10.

SPECIAL TERMS & CONDITIONS

VENDOR NAME :

VENDOR NUMBER: -
ITB NO. : 10-X-2215350
OPEN DATE : 01/14/10 TIME: 10:00 AM
T-NUMBER : TA761
RETURN DATE: 01/13/10 TIME: 5:00 PM

PAGE 5

INVITATION TO BID

UNIT OF MEASURE:

THE UNIT OF MEASURE INDICATED ON EACH LINE MUST BE BID. FAILURE TO BID THE UNIT OF MEASURE AS SHOWN WILL RESULT IN LINE REJECTION.

"EA" = EACH
"SY" = SQUARE YARD
"LB" = POUND
"BOX" = "BOX"

MATERIALS, SUPPLIES OR EQUIPMENT:

ALL MATERIALS, SUPPLIES OR EQUIPMENT BEING BID AND DELIVERED TO THE STATE SHALL BE NEW, UNUSED, OF RECENT MANUFACTURE, FIRST CLASS IN EVERY RESPECT, AND SUITABLE FOR THEIR INTENDED PURPOSE.

REQUESTED INFORMATION:

ANY ADDITIONAL INFORMATION REQUESTED FROM A VENDOR MUST BE FURNISHED WITHIN FIVE (5) BUSINESS DAYS FROM RECEIPT OF REQUEST.

QUANTITY:

THE STATE DOES NOT GUARANTEE THAT ANY CERTAIN QUANTITY OF MATERIALS WILL BE PURCHASED FROM THIS CONTRACT. ORDERS WILL BE PLACED AT DOT HAS NEED.

ATTACHMENTS

VENDOR NAME :

VENDOR NUMBER: -
ITB NO. : 10-X-2215350
OPEN DATE : 01/14/10 TIME: 10:00 AM
T-NUMBER : TA761
RETURN DATE: 01/13/10 TIME: 5:00 PM

PAGE 6

INVITATION TO BID

***** IMPORTANT INFORMATION *****

IT IS THE VENDOR'S RESPONSIBILITY TO READ THIS ENTIRE DOCUMENT FROM BEGINNING TO END AND TO COMPLY WITH ALL INSTRUCTIONS AND TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE ITB.

REMINDER: BIDDERS MUST SUBMIT AN ORIGINAL AND A MINIMUM OF ONE EXACT, COMPLETE COPY (INCLUDING SIGNATURE AND NOTARY) OF THE BID, AS SHOWN ON PAGE 2 OF THE ITB, OR THE BID WILL BE REJECTED.

FOR SPECIFICATION QUESTIONS, CONTACT THE AGENCY:
TRACY GORE @ (334) 242-6244

FOR PROCEDURAL QUESTIONS, CONTACT THE BUYER:
SUSAN JANA @ (334) 242-7173 OR SUSAN.JANA@PURCHASING.ALABAMA.GOV

REMINDER: CHANGES TO SPECIFICATIONS MAY ONLY BE DONE VIA A WRITTEN ADDENDUM. VERBAL SPECIFICATION CHANGES ARE NOT ALLOWED.

PRICE SHEET

VENDOR NAME :

VENDOR NUMBER: -
ITB NO. : 10-X-2215350 PAGE 7
OPEN DATE : 01/14/10 TIME: 10:00 AM
T-NUMBER : TA761
RETURN DATE: 01/13/10 TIME: 5:00 PM

INVITATION TO BID

LINE NO.	COMMODITY/SERVICE DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	UNIT	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED AMOUNT
UNLESS SPECIFIED OTHERWISE BELOW: SHIP TO: 012001 / 012M02 ALA DEPT OF TRANSPORTATION STATEWIDE . . AL 00000					
00001	COMMODITY CODE: 085-85-091720 EROSION CONTROL PRODUCTS, AS FOLLOWS: WATTLE 20" X 10' PER ALDOT MSDSAR SPECIFICATIONS LIST II-24 MFR: _____ MDL _____ AMERICAN EXCELSIOR CO. PREMIERE STRAW WATTLE OR EQUAL	1	EA	_____	_____
00002	COMMODITY CODE: 085-85-091720 EROSION CONTROL PRODUCTS, AS FOLLOWS: SILT FENCE KIT TYPE A PER ALDOT MSDSAR SPECIFICATIONS LIST II-3 SECTION 665 MFR _____ MDL _____ MAFRI MODEL 140 NL OR EQUAL	1	EA	_____	_____
00004	COMMODITY CODE: 085-85-091720 EROSION CONTROL PRODUCTS, AS FOLLOWS: ROLLED EROSION CONTROL PRODUCTS TYPE 1-D ULTRA SHORT TERM (3 MONTH FUNCTIONAL LONGEVITY) PER ALDOT MSDSAR SPECIFICATIONS LIST II-11 LENGTH: _____ WIDTH: _____ MFR: _____ MDL: _____ AMERICAN EXCELSIOR CO PREMIERE STRAW DN OR EQUAL	1	SY	_____	_____
00005	COMMODITY CODE: 085-85-091720 EROSION CONTROL PRODUCTS, AS FOLLOWS: ROLLED EROSION CONTROL PRODUCTS TYPE 2-C SHORT TERM RECP (12 MONTH FUNCTIONAL LONGEVITY) PER ALDOT MSDSAR SPECIFICATIONS LIST II-11 LENGTH: _____ WIDTH: _____ MFR: _____ MDL: _____ NORTH AMERICAN GREEN S-75 OR EQUAL	1	SY	_____	_____
00006	COMMODITY CODE: 085-85-091720 EROSION CONTROL PRODUCTS, AS FOLLOWS:	1	SY	_____	_____
PAGE TOTAL					_____

PRICE SHEET

VENDOR NAME :

VENDOR NUMBER: -
 ITB NO. : 10-X-2215350 PAGE 8
 OPEN DATE : 01/14/10 TIME: 10:00 AM
 T-NUMBER : TA761
 RETURN DATE: 01/13/10 TIME: 5:00 PM

INVITATION TO BID

LINE NO.	COMMODITY/SERVICE DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	UNIT	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED AMOUNT
	ROLLED EROSION CONTROL PRODUCTS TYPE 3-B EXTENDED TERM (24 MONTH FUNCTIONAL LONGGEVITY) PER ALDOT MSDSAR SPECIFICATIONS LIST II-11 LENGTH: _____ WIDTH: _____ MFR: _____ MDL: _____ AMERICAN EXCELSIOR CURLEX II FIBRENET OR EQUAL				
00007	COMMODITY CODE: 085-85-091720 EROSION CONTROL PRODUCTS, AS FOLLOWS: ROLLED EROSION CONTROL PRODUCTS TYPE 4 LONG TERM (36 MONTH FUNCTIONAL LONGEVITY) PER ALDOT MSDSAR SPECIFICATIONS LIST II-11 LENGTH: _____ WIDTH: _____ MFR: _____ MDL: _____ NORTH AMERICAN GREEN C-125 OR EQUAL	1	SY	_____	_____
00008	COMMODITY CODE: 085-85-091720 EROSION CONTROL PRODUCTS, AS FOLLOWS: ROLLED EROSION CONTROL PRODUCTS TYPE 5-C PERMANENT PER ALDOT MSDSAR SPECIFICATIONS LIST II-11 LENGTH: _____ WIDTH: _____ MFR: _____ MDL: _____ NORTH AMERICAN GREEN P-550 OR EQUAL	1	SY	_____	_____
00009	COMMODITY CODE: 085-85-091720 EROSION CONTROL PRODUCTS, AS FOLLOWS: MULCH, EMULSIFIED, TACKIFIER PER ALDOT MSDSAR SPECIFICATIONS LIST II-20 MFR: _____ MDL: _____ PROFILE PRODUCTS TERRA-MULCH TACKING AGENT 3MULCH OR EQUAL	1	LB	_____	_____
00010	COMMODITY CODE: 085-85-091720 EROSION CONTROL PRODUCTS, AS FOLLOWS: GEOTEXTILES PER ALDOT MSDSAR SPECIFICATIONS LIST II-3: ARTICLE 219.02 LANDSLIDE CORRECTIONS,	1	SY	_____	_____
	PAGE TOTAL				_____

PRICE SHEET

VENDOR NAME :

VENDOR NUMBER: -
ITB NO. : 10-X-2215350 PAGE 9
OPEN DATE : 01/14/10 TIME: 10:00 AM
T-NUMBER : TA761
RETURN DATE: 01/13/10 TIME: 5:00 PM

INVITATION TO BID

LINE NO.	COMMODITY/SERVICE DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	UNIT	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED AMOUNT
	ARTICLE 605.02 PAVEMENT EDGE DRAIN, SUBARTICLE 609.02 (A) AGGREGATE SLOPE PROTECTION ARTICLE 610.02 RIPRAP PERMANENT EROSION CONTROL MFR: _____ MDL: _____ PROPEX, INC. GEOTEX 801 OR EQUAL				
00011	COMMODITY CODE: 085-85-091720 EROSION CONTROL PRODUCTS, AS FOLLOWS: FLOATING BASIN BOOM 6' X 100' STANDARD TYPE 1 KIT MUST BE REINFORCED FABRIC ATTACHED ON THE UPPER SIDE TO FLOTATION MEMBERS AND BALLASTED ON THE LOWER SIDE WITH CHAINS OR WEIGHTS. FLOTATION MEMBERS SHALL BE MADE OF FOAM WITH A MINIMUM DIAMETER OF 6 INCHES. THE BALLAST SHALL BE OF GALVANIZED PROOF COIL CHAINS OR OTHER ACCEPTABLE WEIGHTS CAPABLE OF RETAINING SKIRT IN A VERTICAL POSITION. THE BOOM SHALL BE YELLOW OR INTERNATIONAL ORANGE IN COLOR. MFR: _____ MDL: _____ AER FLO TOUGH GUY TYPE 1 OR EQUAL	1	EA	_____	_____
00012	COMMODITY CODE: 085-85-091720 EROSION CONTROL PRODUCTS, AS FOLLOWS: STAPLES, U-SHAPED STEEL APPROX 6" L X 1" W. MACHINE MADE STAPLES SHALL BE OF #11 GAUGE OR HEAVIER STEEL WIRE. USED TO FASTEN EROSION CONTROL NETTING TO THE SOIL SURFACE - 1000 STAPLES PER BOX MFR: _____ MDL: _____ WIRE PRODUCTS, INC # 6111 OR EQUAL	1	BOX	_____	_____
00013	COMMODITY CODE: 085-85-091720 EROSION CONTROL PRODUCTS, AS FOLLOWS: BAG, SAND, WOVEN POLPROPYLENE EACH BAG SHALL HAVE MINIMUM DEMENSION OF 18" X 12" X 3" AND MUST HAVE A MINIMUM WEIGHT CAPACITY OF 30 LBS. TO BE PURCHASED BY CASE MFR: _____ MDL: _____ EROSION CONTROL INC 14981 OR EQUAL	1	EA	_____	_____
00014	COMMODITY CODE: 085-85-091720 EROSION CONTROL PRODUCTS, AS FOLLOWS:	1	SY	_____	_____
	PAGE TOTAL				_____

PRICE SHEET

VENDOR NAME :

VENDOR NUMBER: -
ITB NO. : 10-X-2215350 PAGE 10
OPEN DATE : 01/14/10 TIME: 10:00 AM
T-NUMBER : TA761
RETURN DATE: 01/13/10 TIME: 5:00 PM

INVITATION TO BID

LINE NO.	COMMODITY/SERVICE DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY	UNIT	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED AMOUNT
	POLYETHYLENE SHEETING FOR CONSTRUCTION MINIMUM 6 ML THICKNESS (IN ROLLS) COLOR: BLACK OR CLEAR				
	MFR: _____ MDL: _____ TEX-TRUDE OR EQUAL				
00015	COMMODITY CODE: 962-86-052032 FREIGHT CHARGES FOR DELIVERY ORDERS OF < \$200.00	1	LOT	_____	_____

PAGE TOTAL _____
BID TOTAL _____

#10-X-2215350

Approval Date: July 6, 2004
Revised Date: September 14, 2009
PAGE 1 OF 2

ALABAMA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

LIST II-24

EROSION CONTROL WATTLES

PRODUCT NAME	VENDOR CODE	DATE APPROVED
AMERICAN EXCELSIOR SEDIMENT LOG	1	05/03/04
SILT TRAPPER 3 BEWN WATTLE STRAW	3	06/01/04
SILT TRAPPER 5 BKWN WATTLE STRAW	3	06/01/04
SILT TRAPPER 5 LPN FIBRE STRAW/COIR	3	06/01/04
ASPEN EXCELSIOR LOGS	4, 7, 13	12/06/04
SEC 'SEC-LOGS'	5	11/07/05
STRAW WATTLES - E-LOGS	3	02/07/05
ULTRA-STORM WATTLE	6	02/06/06
EXCEL STRAW LOGS	7	06/06/06
NATURAL STRAW WATTLE 2010	8, 11	07/24/06
RSW 2000	9	01/09/07
ET-WTL	10	06/05/07
EROSION EEL	2	08/13/07
FILTREXX FILTER SOX	12	11/05/07
AEC PREMIER STRAW WATTLE	1	09/14/09
EC WATTLES	14	03/05/07

VENDORS

- | | |
|---|---|
| 1. AMERICAN EXCELSIOR COMPANY
850 AVE H EAST, P.O. BOX 5067
ARLINGTON, TX 76005 | 8. WINTERS EXCELSIOR CO.
77 HOLLY ROAD
MCWILLIAMS, AL 36753
800.248.7237/ 251.746.2173 |
| 2. FRIENDLY ENVIRONMENT
100 PRINCE STREET
SHELBYVILLE, TN 37160
615.607.5953 | 9. ROBEX, LLC.
5830 HGIHWAY 161
SPRINGFIELD, TN 37172 |
| 3. SUNSHINE SUPPLIES, INC.
P.O. BOX 8
WATSON, AL 35181 | 10. EROSION TECH
105 PLANT CAMELIA ROAD
JULIETTE, GA 31046 |
| 4. IKEX INC.
321 CORPORATION PARKWAY
MACON, GA 31210 | 11. UNIVERSALL ECS, INC.
5521 EASTCLIFF INDUSTRIAL BLVD.
JULIETTE, GA 31046 |
| 5. SOUTHERN ENVIRONMENTAL CONSERVATION, INC.
902 MAIN AVENUE, SUITE A
NORTHPORT, AL 35476 | 12. FILTRES INTERNATIONAL
35481 GRAFTON EASTERN ROAD
GRAFTON, OH 35242 |
| 6. ULTRATECH INTERNATIONAL, INC.
11542 DAVIS CREEK CT.
JACKSONVILLE, FL 32256 | 13. CENTRAL SEED & SUPPLY
13055 US HWY 11
SPRINGFIELD, AL 35146 |
| 7. WESTERN EXCELSIOR
901 GRAND AVENUE
MANCOS, CO 81328 | 14. EAST COAST EROSION CONTROL BL.
443 Bricker Road
BERNSVILLE, PA 19506 |

ALABAMA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

LIST II-3

GEOTEXTILES

PRODUCT NAME	VENDOR CODE	DATE APPROVED	TERMINAL DATE
--------------	-------------	---------------	---------------

**ARTICLE 219.02 LANDSLIDE CORRECTION
SUBSURFACE DRAINAGE**

(Soil with >50 % passing .075 mm sieve)

Contech C60NW	12	10/06/03
CARTHAGE MILLS FX-60HS	7, 20, 22	01/10/00
DalTex 1060	19	02/06/06
DalTex 1080	19	02/06/06
FIBERWEB - TYPAR 3631	10	01/10/00
GEOTEX 601	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 701	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 801	4, 20	01/10/00
GSE NW 6	18	10/03/05
GSE NW 8	18	10/03/05
GSE NW 12	18	10/03/05
LINQ INDUSTRIAL FABRICS 150 EX	13	01/10/00
MIDWEST CONSTRUCTION PRODUCTS GFNW6	9	04/07/08
MIRAFI STYLE 160N	8	01/10/00
SKAPS GT-160	15, 17	05/03/04
TENAX TG-600	1	01/10/00
TERRAM 1300 UVDG	16	06/01/04
TERRAM 1500 UVDG	16	06/01/04
TerraTex No. 6	25,26	04/07/08
TNS ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES R060	11	01/10/00
TNS ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES R080	11	01/10/00
TYPAR 3601G	24	07/06/09
WEBTEC TerraTex NO6	5	01/10/00
WEBTEC TerraTex NO7	5	01/10/00
WEBTEC TerraTex NO8	5	01/10/00
Western Excelsior Excel 6.0N	15, 23	05/04/09

(Soil with 15 to 50% passing the .075 mm sieve)

Contech C60NW	12	10/06/03
CARTHAGE MILLS FX-60HS	7, 20, 22	01/10/00
DalTex 1060	19	02/06/06
DalTex 1080	19	02/06/06
FIBERWEB - TYPAR 3631	24	01/10/00
GEOTEX 601	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 701	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 801	4, 20	01/10/00
GSE NW 6	18	10/03/05
GSE NW 8	18	10/03/05
GSE NW 12	18	10/03/05
LINQ INDUSTRIAL FABRICS 150 EX	13	01/10/00
MIDWEST CONSTRUCTION PRODUCTS GFNW6	9	04/07/08
MIRAFI STYLE 160	8	01/10/00
SKAPS GT-160	15, 17	05/03/04
TENAX TG-600	1	01/10/00

ALABAMA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
LIST II-3
GEOTEXTILES

APPROVAL DATE September 5, 2000
THIS REVISION November 12, 2009
Page 2 of 10

TERRAM 1300 UVDG	16	06/01/04
TERRAM 1500 UVDG	16	06/01/04
TerraTex No. 6	25,26	04/07/08
TNS ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES R060	11	01/10/00
TNS ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES R080	11	01/10/00
TYPAR 3601G	24	07/06/09
WEBTEC TerraTex NO6	5	01/10/00
WEBTEC TerraTex NO7	5	01/10/00
WEBTEC TerraTex NO8	5	01/10/00
Western Excelsior Excel 6.0N	15, 23	05/04/09

(Soil with <15 % passing the .075 mm sieve)

Contech C60NW	12	10/06/03
CARTHAGE MILLS FX-60HS	7, 20, 22	01/10/00
DalTex 1060	19	02/06/06
DalTex 1080	19	02/06/06
FIBERWEB - TYPAR 3631	24	01/10/00
GEOTEX 601	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 701	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 801	4, 20	01/10/00
GSE NW 6	18	10/03/05
GSE NW 8	18	10/03/05
GSE NW 12	18	10/03/05
LINQ INDUSTRIAL FABRICS 150 EX	13	01/10/00
MIRAFI STYLE 160N	8	01/10/00
SKAPS GT-160	15,17	05/03/04
TENAX TG-600	1	01/10/00
TERRAM 1300 UVDG	16	06/01/04
TERRAM 1500 UVDG	16	06/01/04
TerraTex No. 6	25,26	04/07/08
TNS ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES R060	11	01/10/00
TNS ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES R080	11	01/10/00
TYPAR 3601G	24	07/06/09
WEBTEC TerraTex NO6	5	01/10/00
WEBTEC TerraTex NO7	5	01/10/00
WEBTEC TerraTex NO8	5	01/10/00
Western Excelsior Excel 6.0N	15, 23	05/04/09

SECTION 604
GEOTEXTILES IN PERMEABLE ASPHALT
TREATED BASE APPLICATION

C40NW	12	10/06/03
CARTHAGE MILLS FX-420L	7, 20, 22	01/10/00
DalTex 1045	19	02/06/06
DalTex 1060	19	02/06/06
DalTex 1080	19	02/06/06
GEOTEX 401	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 451	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 501	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 601	4, 20	01/10/00
GSE NW 4	18	10/03/05
GSE NW 6	18	10/03/05
GSE NW 8	18	10/03/05
GSE NW 12	18	10/03/05
LINQ INDUSTRIAL FABRICS 125EX/A0L	13	01/10/00

LINQ INDUSTRIAL FABRICS 130EX	13	01/10/00
LINQ INDUSTRIAL FABRICS 140EX	13	01/10/00
LINQ INDUSTRIAL FABRICS 150EX	13	01/10/00
LINQ INDUSTRIAL FABRICS 160EX	13	01/10/00
LINQ INDUSTRIAL FABRICS TYPAR 3401	13	11/03/00
MIDWEST CONSTRUCTION PRODUCTS GFNW4	9	04/07/08
MIDWEST CONSTRUCTION PRODUCTS GFNW6	9	04/07/08
MIDWEST CONSTRUCTION PRODUCTS GFNW7	9	04/07/08
MIRAFI STYLE 140N	8	09/05/00
MIRAFI STYLE 160N	8	09/05/00
PETROMAT 4598	4	09/05/00
SKAPS GT-160	5, 17	05/03/04
TENAX PGM -15	1	01/10/00
TENAX TG500	1	10/01/01
TERRAM 900 UVDG	16	06/01/04
TERRAM 1300 UVDG	16	06/01/04
TerraTex No. 6	25,26	04/07/08
TNS ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES R060	11	08/05/02
TYPAR 3601G	24	07/06/09
WEBTEC TerraTex NO4.5	5	01/10/00
WEBTEC TerraTex NO5	5	01/10/00
Western Excelsior Excel 6.0N	15, 23	05/04/09

**ITEM 605.02(a)1. PAVEMENT EDGE DRAIN
 SUBSURFACE DRAINAGE2
 (Soil with >50 % passing .075 mm sieve)**

C60NW	12	10/06/03
CARTHAGE MILLS FX-60HS	7, 20, 22	01/10/00
DalTex 1060	19	02/06/06
DalTex 1080	19	02/06/06
FIBERWEB - TYPAR 3631	24	01/10/00
GSE NW 6	18	10/03/05
GSE NW 8	18	10/03/05
GSE NW 12	18	10/03/05
GEOTEX 451	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 601	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 701	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 801	4, 20	01/10/00
LINQ INDUSTRIAL FABRICS 150 EX	13	01/10/00
MIDWEST CONSTRUCTION PRODUCTS GFNW6	9	04/07/08
MIRAFI STYLE 160N	8	01/10/00
SKAPS GT-160	15, 17	05/03/04
TENAX TG-600	1	1/10/00
TERRAM 1300 UVDG	16	06/01/04
TERRAM 1500 UVDG	16	06/01/04
TerraTex No. 6	25,26	04/07/08
TNS ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES R060	11	01/10/00
TNS ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES R080	11	01/10/00
TYPAR 3601G	24	07/06/09
WEBTEC TerraTex NO6	5	01/10/00
WEBTEC TerraTex NO7	5	01/10/00
WEBTEC TerraTex NO8	5	01/10/00
Western Excelsior Excel 6.0N	15, 23	05/04/09

(Soil with 15 to 50% passing the .075 mm sieve)

C60NW	12	10/06/03
CARTHAGE MILLS FX-60HS	7, 20, 22	01/10/00
DalTex 1060	19	02/06/06
DalTex 1080	19	02/06/06
FIBERWEB - TYPAR 3631	24	01/10/00
GEOTEX 451	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 601	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 701	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 801	4, 20	01/10/00
GSE NW 6	18	10/03/05
GSE NW 8	18	10/03/05
GSE NW 12	18	10/03/05
LINQ INDUSTRIAL FABRICS 150 EX	13	01/10/00
MIRAFI STYLE 160N	8	01/10/00
SKAPS GT-160	15, 17	05/03/04
TENAX TG-600	1	01/10/00
TERRAM 1300 UVDG	16	06/01/04
TERRAM 1500 UVDG	16	06/01/04
TerraTex No. 6	25,26	04/07/08
TNS ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES R060	11	01/10/00
TNS ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES R080	11	01/10/00
TYPAR 3601G	24	07/06/09
WEBTEC TerraTex NO6	5	01/10/00
WEBTEC TerraTex NO7	5	01/10/00
WEBTEC TerraTex NO8	5	01/10/00
Western Excelsior Excel 6.0N	15, 23	05/04/09

(Soil with <15 % passing the .075 mm sieve)

C60NW	12	10/06/03
CARTHAGE MILLS FX-60HS	7, 20, 22	01/10/00
DalTex 1080	19	02/06/06
FIBERWEB - TYPAR 3631	24	01/10/00
GEOTEX 451	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 601	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 701	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 801	4, 20	01/10/00
GSE NW 6	18	10/03/05
GSE NW 8	18	10/03/05
GSE NW 12	18	10/03/05
LINQ INDUSTRIAL FABRICS 150 EX	13	01/10/00
MIRAFI STYLE 160N	8	01/10/00
SKAPS GT-160	15, 17	05/03/04
TENAX TG-600	1	01/10/00
TERRAM 1300 UVDG	16	06/01/04
TERRAM 1500 UVDG	16	06/01/04
TerraTex No. 6	25,26	04/07/08
TNS ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES R060	11	01/10/00
TNS ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES R080	11	01/10/00
TYPAR 3601G	24	07/06/09
WEBTEC TerraTex NO6	5	01/10/00
WEBTEC TerraTex NO7	5	01/10/00
WEBTEC TerraTex NO8	5	01/10/00
Western Excelsior Excel 6.0N	15, 23	05/04/09

**ARTICLE 605.02(d) 1 PAVEMENT EDGE DRAIN
PREFABRICATED SUBSURFACE DRAINAGE MAT**

ARTICLE 607.02(a) PAVING GEOTEXTILE

C46NW	12	10/06/03
CARTHAGE MILLS FX-420L	7, 20, 22	01/10/00
GSE NW 6	18	10/03/05
GSE NW 8	18	10/03/05
GSE NW 12	18	10/03/05
MilRAPAVE 500	8	01/10/00
PETROMAT 4598	4, 20	01/10/00
PETROMAT 4599	4, 20	01/10/00
TerraTex No. 6	25,26	04/07/08
TENAX PGM-15	1	01/10/00
TNS ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES	11	01/10/00
TYPAR 3601G	24	07/06/09
WEBTEC OL	5	01/10/00

ARTICLE 608.02 SEPARATION APPLICATIONS

C60NW	12	10/06/03
CARTHAGE MILLS FX-60HS	7, 20, 22	01/10/00
DalTex 1060	19	02/06/06
DalTex 1080	19	02/06/06
FIBERWEB - TYPAR 3631	24	01/10/00
GEOTEX 601	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 701	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 801	4, 20	01/10/00
GSE NW 6	18	10/03/05
GSE NW 8	18	10/03/05
GSE NW 12	18	10/03/05
LIHQ INDUSTRIAL FABRICS 150 EX	13	01/10/00
MIDWEST CONSTRUCTION PRODUCTS GFNW6	9	04/07/08
MIRAFI STYLE 160N	8	01/10/00
SKAPS GT-160	15, 17	05/03/04
TENAX TG-600	1	01/10/00
TERRAM 1300 UVDG	16	06/01/04
TERRAM 1500 UVDG	16	06/01/04
TerraTex No. 6	25,26	04/07/08
TNS ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES R060	11	01/10/00
TNS ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES R080	11	01/10/00
TYPAR 3601G	24	07/06/09
WEBTEC TerraTex NO7	5	01/10/00
WEBTEC TerraTex NO8	5	01/10/00
Western Excelsior Excel 6.0N	15, 23	05/04/09

**SUBARTICLE 609.02(a) AGGREGATE SLOPE PROTECTION
 PERMANENT EROSION CONTROL**

**(Note: The geotextiles for this use must have a coefficient of friction test by the Central Lab.
 Submit samples of the geotextiles and aggregates prior to installation)**

(Soil with >50 % passing .075 mm sieve)

C60NW	12	10/06/03
CARTHAGE MILLS FX-60HS	7, 20, 22	01/10/00
DalTex 1060	19	02/06/06
DalTex 1080	19	02/06/06
FIBERWEB - TYPAR 3631	24	01/10/00
GEOTEX 601	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 701	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 801	4, 20	01/10/00
GSE NW 4	18	10/03/05
GSE NW 6	18	10/03/05
GSE NW 8	18	10/03/05
GSE NW 12	18	10/03/05
LINQ INDUSTRIAL FABRICS 180 EX	13	01/10/00
MIDWEST CONSTRUCTION PRODUCTS GFNW8	9	04/07/08
MIRAFI STYLE 160N	8	01/10/00
SKAPS GT-160	15, 17	05/03/04
SKAPS GT-180	15, 17	05/03/04
TENAX TG-600	1	01/10/00
TERRAM 1300 UVDG	16	06/01/04
TERRAM 1500 UVDG	16	06/01/04
TerraTex No. 6	25,26	04/07/08
TNS ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES R060	11	01/10/00
TNS ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES R080	11	01/10/00
TYPAR 3601G	24	07/06/09
WEBTEC EP	5	01/10/00
WEBTEC TerraTex NO8	5	01/10/00
Western Excelsior Excel 6.0N	15, 23	05/04/09

(Soil with 15 to 50% passing the .075 mm sieve)

C60NW	12	10/06/03
CARTHAGE MILLS FX-60HS	7, 20, 22	01/10/00
DalTex 1060	19	02/06/06
DalTex 1080	19	02/06/06
FIBERWEB - TYPAR 3631	24	01/10/00
GEOTEX 601	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 701	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 801	4, 20	01/10/00
GSE NW 4	18	10/03/05
GSE NW 6	18	10/03/05
GSE NW 8	18	10/03/05
GSE NW 12	18	10/03/05
LINQ INDUSTRIAL FABRICS 180 EX	13	01/10/00
MIDWEST CONSTRUCTION PRODUCTS GFNW8	9	04/07/08
MIRAFI STYLE 160N	8	01/10/00
SKAPS GT-160	15, 17	05/03/04
SKAPS GT-180	15, 17	05/03/04
TENAX TG-600	1	01/10/00
TERRAM 1300 UVDG	16	06/01/04
TERRAM 1500 UVDG	16	06/01/04
TerraTex No. 6	25,26	04/07/08

ALABAMA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
LIST II-3
GEOTEXTILES

APPROVAL DATE September 5, 2000
THIS REVISION November 12, 2009
Page 7 of 10

TNS ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES R060	11	01/10/00
TNS ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES R080	11	01/10/00
TYPAR 3601G	24	07/06/09
WEBTEC TerraTex NO8	5	01/10/00
Western Excelsior Excel 6.0N	15, 23	05/04/09

(Soil with <15 % passing the .075 mm sieve)

C60NW	12	10/06/03
CARTHAGE MILLS FX-60HS	7, 20, 22	01/10/00
DalTex 1060	19	02/06/06
DalTex 1080	19	02/06/06
FIBERWEB - TYPAR 3631	24	01/10/00
GEOTEX 601	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 701	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 801	4, 20	01/10/00
GSE NW 4	18	10/03/05
GSE NW 6	18	10/03/05
GSE NW 8	18	10/03/05
GSE NW 12	18	10/03/05
LINQ INDUSTRIAL FABRICS 180 EX	13	01/10/00
MIDWEST CONSTRUCTION PRODUCTS GFNW8	9	04/07/08
MIRAFI STYLE 160N	8	01/10/00
SKAPS GT-160	15, 17	05/03/04
SKAPS GT-180	15, 17	05/03/04
TENAX TG-600	1	01/10/00
TERRAM 1300 UVDG	16	06/01/04
TERRAM 1500 UVDG	16	06/01/04
TerraTex No. 6	25, 26	04/07/08
TNS ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES R060	11	01/10/00
TNS ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES R080	11	01/10/00
TYPAR 3601G	24	07/06/09
WEBTEC TerraTex NO8	5	01/10/00
Western Excelsior Excel 6.0N	15, 23	05/04/09

ARTICLE 610.02 RIPRAP
PERMANENT EROSION CONTROL

(Soil with >50 % passing .075 mm sieve)

C80NW	12	10/06/03
CARTHAGE MILLS FX-70HS	7, 20, 22	01/10/00
CARTHAGE MILLS FX-80HS	7, 20, 22	01/10/00
DalTex 1080	19	02/06/06
FIBERWEB - TYPAR 3631	24	01/10/00
GEOTEX 801	4, 20	01/10/00
GSE NW 8	18	10/03/05
GSE NW 12	18	10/03/05
LINQ INDUSTRIAL FABRICS 180 EX	13	01/10/00
MIRAFI STYLE 180N	8	01/10/00
SKAPS GT-180	15, 17	05/03/04
TENAX TG-650	1	01/10/00
TENAX TG-700	1	01/10/00
TERRAM 1500 UVDG	16	06/01/04
TNS ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES R080	11	01/10/00
TYPAR 3601G	24	07/06/09
WEBTEC TerraTex NO8	5	01/10/00
Western Excelsior WE-8.0N	15, 23	05/04/09

(Soil with 15 to 50% passing the .075 mm sieve)

C80NW	12	10/06/03
CARTHAGE MILLS FX-70HS	7, 20, 22	01/10/00
CARTHAGE MILLS FX-80HS	7, 20, 22	01/10/00
DalTex 1080	19	02/06/06
FIBERWEB - TYPAR 3631	24	01/10/00
GEOTEX 801	4, 20	01/10/00
GSE NW 8	18	10/03/05
GSE NW 12	18	10/03/05
LINQ INDUSTRIAL FABRICS 180 EX	13	01/10/00
MIRAFI STYLE 180N	8	01/10/00
SKAPS GT-180	15, 17	05/03/04
TENAX TG-650	1	01/10/00
TENAX TG-700	1	01/10/00
TERRAM 1500 UVDG	16	06/01/04
TNS ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES R080	11	01/10/00
TYPAR 3601G	24	07/06/09
WEBTEC TerraTex NO8	5	01/10/00
Western Excelsior WE-8.0N	15, 23	05/04/09

(Soil with <15 % passing the .075 mm sieve)

C80NW	12	10/06/03
CARTHAGE MILLS FX-70HS	7, 20, 22	01/10/00
CARTHAGE MILLS FX-80HS	7, 20, 22	01/10/00
DalTex 1080	19	02/06/06
FIBERWEB - TYPAR 3631	24	01/10/00
GEOTEX 801	4, 20	01/10/00
GSE NW 8	18	10/03/05
GSE NW 12	18	10/03/05
LINQ INDUSTRIAL FABRICS 180 EX	13	01/10/00
MIRAFI STYLE 180N	8	01/10/00
SKAPS GT-180	15, 17	05/03/04
TENAX TG-650	1	01/10/00
TENAX TG-700	1	01/10/00
TERRAM 1500 UVDG	16	06/01/04
TNS ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES R080	11	01/10/00
TYPAR 3601G	24	07/06/09
WEBTEC Terra Tex NO8	5	01/10/00
Western Excelsior WE-8.0N	15, 23	05/04/09

**SECTION 665 TEMPORARY EROSION CONTROL
 SILT FENCE
 WIRE SUPPORTED**

BELTON AEF-600W	3	01/10/00
BELTON 200 NO.776	3	01/10/00
BELTON 300 NO. 777	3	01/10/00
BELTON 400 NO. 113	3	01/10/00
CONTECH C31NW	12	01/10/00
CONTECH C38NW	12	01/10/00
CONTECH C40NW	12	01/10/00
CONTECH C45NW	12	01/10/00
CONTECH C46NW	12	01/10/00
CONTECH C60NW	12	01/10/00
CONTECH C70/60	12	01/10/00
CONTECH C70NW	12	01/10/00
CONTECH C80NW	12	01/10/00
FX-35HS	7, 22	05/15/07
FX-40CF	7, 22	01/10/00
GEOTEX 104F	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 311	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 351	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 401	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 451	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 501	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 601	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 651	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 701	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 801	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 1101	4, 20	01/10/00
GEOTEX 2130	4, 20	01/10/00
LINQ INDUSTRIAL FABRICS 125EX/AOL	13	01/10/00
LINQ INDUSTRIAL FABRICS 130 EX	13	01/10/00
MIDWEST CONSTRUCTION PRODUCTS GFNW3.5	9	04/07/08
MIDWEST CONSTRUCTION PRODUCTS GFNW4	9	04/07/08
MIRAFI STYLE 100 CX	8	01/10/00
MIRAFI STYLE 140 NL	8	01/10/00
PAVE DRY 361	9	01/10/00
PAVE DRY 381	9	01/10/00
PAVE DRY 461	9	01/10/00
PETROMAT 4598	4	10/01/01
PHOENIX NW-5P	2	01/10/00
PHOENIX NW-8P	2	01/10/00
REEMAY 3341G	10	01/10/00
REEMAY 3401G	10	01/10/00
REEMAY 3501G	10	01/10/00
REEMAY 3601G	10	01/10/00
REEMAY 3631G	10	01/10/00
SKAPS GT-135	15	07/05/05
TENAX TG500	1	01/10/00
TNS ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES R035	11	01/10/00
TNS ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES R060	11	01/10/00
TNS ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES R100	11	01/10/00
WEBTEC TerraTex NO4	5	01/10/00
Western Excelsior WE-3.5N	15, 23	05/04/09

VENDORS

1. Tenax Corporation
4800 East Monument Street
Baltimore, Md. 21205
2. Bradley Materials
P O Box 368
Valparaiso, Fl 32580
3. Belton Industries
8613 Roswell Rd
Atlanta, Ga. 30350
4. Propex Inc
6025 Lee Highway, Suite 425
PO Box 22788
Chattanooga, TN 37422
(800) 621-1273
5. Hanes Geo Components
815 Buxton Street
Winston-Salem, NC 27101
(336) 725-1391
6. Nicolon
3500 Parkway Lane
Norcross, Ga. 30092
7. Carthage Mills
4243 Hunt Road
Chattanooga, Tn 37416
8. TC Mirafli
365 South Holland Dr.
Pendergrass, Ga. 30567
9. Synthetic Industries
4019 Industry Drive
Chattanooga, TN 37416
10. Reemay, Inc
70 Old Hickory Blvd
Old Hickory, Tn 37138
11. TNS Advanced Technologies
681 Deyoung Road
Greer, Sc 29651
12. Contech Construction
P O Box 800
Middletown, Oh 45042
13. Linq Industrial Fabrics, Inc
2550 West Fifth North Street
Summerville, SC 29483-9669
14. Cady Industries, Inc.
509 North King Street
Pearson, Ga 31642
15. Skaps Industries
316 South Holland Drive
Pendergrass, Ga 30567
16. Interlock Industries
P. O. Box 92
Tigerville, Sc 29688
17. Tricia Davies, President
Erosion Control & Environmental Supply, Inc.
480 Dean Road, A-11
Auburn, AL 36830
18. GSE Lining Technology, Inc.
19103 Gundie Road
Houston, TX 77073
19. Dalco Nonwoven, LLC
2050 Evergreen Dr., NE
Conover, NC 28613
20. Universal ECS, Inc.
5521 Eastcliff Industrial Blvd.
Birmingham, AL 35124
(205) 838-1400
21. Ikex, Inc.
4983 Perimeter Way, Suite 131
Bessemer, AL 35022
(205) 359-0478
22. Central Seed and Supply
13055 US Highway 11
Springville, AL 35146
(205) 467-9095
23. Western Excelsior
PO Box 270308
Fort Collins, CO 80527
970-631-8366
24. Fiberweb
70 Old Hickory Blvd
Old Hickory, TN 37138
25. Hanes Geo Components
6509-C Northport Blvd.
Charlotte, NC 28216
26. Hanes Geo Components
4983 Perimeter Way Ste. 131
Bessemer, AL 35023

ROLLED EROSION CONTROL PRODUCTS*

	PEB #	Product Name	Type	Manufacturer Code	Vendor Code	Tentative Expiration Date	
ULTRA SHORT TERM REC (3 Month Min. Functional Longevity)	659A025 Rolled Erosion Control Product, Type (1A)						
		ECO-JUTE	1A	4	3	07/31/10	
	659A026 Rolled Erosion Control Product, Type (1B)						
		Curlex NetFree	1B	1		07/31/10	
	659A027 Rolled Erosion Control Product, Type (1C)						
	2076	Curlex I CL	1C	1	2	07/31/10	
		DS-75	1C	11		07/31/10	
		Winterstraw SNG	1C	18	11	07/31/10	
659A028 Rolled Erosion Control Product, Type (1D)							
		AEC Premier Straw DN	1D	2, 3		07/31/11	
		DS-150	1D	11		01/31/12	
SHORT TERM REC (12 Month Min. Functional Longevity)	659A033 Rolled Erosion Control Product, Type (2A)						
	2150	ECS-1B	2A	5	1	01/31/12	
		GEOJUTE	2A	4	3	07/31/10	
	659A034 Rolled Erosion Control Product, Type (2B)						
		Curlex NetFree	2B	1		07/31/10	
	659A035 Rolled Erosion Control Product, Type (2C)						
			AEC Premier Straw SN	2C	2, 3		07/31/11
			Curlex I	2C	1		07/31/12
			Curlex I FibreNet	2C	1		07/31/12
			ECS-1	2C	5	7	07/31/10
			ECX-1	2C	5	7	07/31/10
			ETRS-1	2C	9		07/31/11
			Excel R-1	2C	17	4, 5	07/31/10
	2030		Excel R-1 All Natural	2C	17	4	07/31/11
			Excel SR-1	2C	17	4, 5	07/31/10
	2031		Excel SR-1 All Natural	2C	17	4	07/31/11
			Landlok 10 (Landlok S1)	2C	12	11	07/31/10
		MA-S1	2C	10		07/31/10	
		S-75	2C	11	10	07/31/10	
1950		S1000	2C	6		07/31/11	

	PEB #	Product Name	Type	Manufacturer	Vendor Code	Tentative
				Code		Expiration Date
SHORT TERM RECP (12 Month Min. Functional Longevity)	659A036 Rolled Erosion Control Product, Type (2D)					
		AEC Premier Straw DN	2D	2, 3		07/31/11
	2077	Curlex II CL	2D	1	2	01/31/12
		ECS-2	2D	5	7	01/31/12
	2152	ECS-2B	2D	5	1	01/31/12
	2154	ECSC-2B	2D	5	1	01/31/12
		ECX-2	2D	5	7	07/31/12
		ETRS-2	2D	9		07/31/11
		Excel S-2	2D	17	4, 5	07/31/11
	2029	Excel S-2 All Natural	2D	17	4	07/31/11
		Excel SS-2	2D	17	4, 5	07/31/10
		Excel SS-2 All Natural	2D	17	4, 5	07/31/10
		Landlok 12 (Landlok S2)	2D	12	11	07/31/10
		MA-S2	2D	10		07/31/10
	1871	Robex Shield RS-2	2D	14		07/31/11
		S-150	2D	11		07/31/10
	1949	S2000	2D	6		07/31/12
		SEC-S2	2D	16		07/31/10
		SEC-XL1	2D	15		07/31/10
		WinterStraw HV Bio	2D	18	11	07/31/10
	WinterStraw HVG	2D	18	11	07/31/10	

EXTENDED TERM RECP (24 Month Min. Functional Longevity)	659A040 Rolled Erosion Control Product, Type (3A)					
	659A041 Rolled Erosion Control Product, Type (3B)					
		AEC Premier Straw Coconut	3B	2, 3		07/31/12
		Curlex II	3B	1		07/31/10
		Curlex II Fibrenet	3B	1		07/31/12
	2155	ECC-2B	3B	5	1	01/31/12
		ECSC-2	3B	5	7	01/31/12
	2118	ETSC-70/30	3B	9		01/31/12
		Excel CS-3	3B	17	4, 5	07/31/10
	2028	Excel CS-3 All Natural	3B	17	4	07/31/10
		Excel SD-3	3B	17	4, 5	07/31/10
		Landlok CS2	3B	13	11	07/31/10
		SC-150	3B	11		01/31/12
	2194	SC32	3B	8	8	07/31/11
		WintersChoice	3B	18	11	07/31/10

	PEB #	Product Name	Type	Manufacturer	Vendor Code	Tentative	
				Code		Expiration Date	
LONG TERM RECP (36 Month Min. Functional Longevity)	659A045 Rolled Erosion Control Product, Type (4)						
			AEC Premier Coconut	4	2, 3		01/31/12
			C-125	4	11	10	01/31/12
	2190		C32	4	8	8	01/31/12
			Curlex High Velocity	4	1		07/31/12
			Curlex III	4	1		07/31/12
			ECC-2	4	5	7	01/31/12
	2207		EG-2C	4	7	6	07/31/12
	2117		ETC-100	4	9		01/31/12
			Excel CC-4	4	17	4, 5	07/31/10
			Excel CC-4 All Natural	4	17	4, 5	07/31/10
			Landlok C2	4	13	11	07/31/11
	1873		Robex Shield RSC-4	4	14		07/31/11
	1872		Robex Shield RSSC-3	4	14		07/31/11
	2185		SEC-C2	4	16	9	07/31/12
			WintersCoir	4	19	11	07/31/11

PERMANENT RECP	659A048 Rolled Erosion Control Product, Type (5A)						
			Curlex Enforcer	5A	1		07/31/10
			ECC-3	5A	5	7	01/31/12
			ECP-2	5A	5	7	07/31/12
			Excel PP5-8	5A	17	4, 5	07/31/10
			Landlok TRM 435	5A	12	11	01/31/12
			Pyramat	5A	12	11	01/31/12
	2078		Recyclex-TRM-V	5A	1	2	01/31/12
	659A049 Rolled Erosion Control Product, Type (5B)						
			ETTPP-10	5B	9		07/31/11
		Excel PP5-10	5B	17	4, 5	07/31/10	
		Landlok TRM 450	5B	12	11	01/31/12	
		P-300	5B	11	10	07/31/10	
		SEC-P2	5B	15		07/31/10	
659A050 Rolled Erosion Control Product, Type (5C)							
		AEC Recyclex TRM	5C	1		07/31/12	
		C-350	5C	11	10	07/31/10	
		Excel PP5-12	5C	17	4, 5	07/31/10	
		Landlok 300	5C	12		07/31/11	
		P-550	5C	11	10	07/31/11	
		SC-250	5C	11	10	07/31/11	

* Rolled erosion control products are classified at the manufacturer's highest allowable use & type, as specified in Section 659, Rolled Erosion Control Products of the Alabama Standard Specifications for Highway Construction Book, 2008 Edition.

MANUFACTURING PLANT LOCATIONS

- | | |
|--|--|
| 1 American Excelsior Company
831 Pioneer Avenue
Rice Lake, WI 54868
715-236-5643 / 715-236-5627 fax | 11 North American Green
14649 Highway 41 North
Evansville, IN 47725
800-772-2040 / 812-867-0247 fax |
| 2 American Excelsior Company
4032 Parkway Drive
Florence, AL 35630
715-236-5643 / 715-236-5627 fax | 12 Propex, Inc.
4019 Industry Drive
Chattanooga, TN 37416
800-621-1273 / 423-899-7619 fax |
| 3 American Excelsior Company
180 Cleveland Road
Norwalk, OH 44857
715-236-5643 / 715-236-5627 fax | 13 Propex, Inc.
510 O'Neal Lane
Baton Rouge, LA 70819
800-621-1273 / 423-899-7619 fax |
| 4 Belton Industries, Inc.
5600 Oakbrook Parkway, Suite 150
Norcross, GA 30093
800-225-4099 / 770-248-1655 fax | 14 Robex, LLC
5830 Highway 161
Springfield, TN 37172
615-382-3300 / 615-382-9051 fax |
| 5 East Coast Erosion Blankets, LLC
443 Bricker Road
Bernville, PA 19506
610-488-8496 / 610-488-8494 fax | 15 Southern Environmental Conservation
902 Main Avenue, Suite A
Northport, AL 35476
205-752-1134 / 205-752-1206 fax |
| 6 Enviroscope ECM
22700 SR-613
Oakwood, OH 45873
419-594-3210 / 419-594-3213 fax | 16 Southern Environmental Conservation
2813 14th Ave N
Columbus, MS 39701
205-752-1134 / 205-752-1206 fax |
| 7 Ero-Guard, Inc.
412 Hwy 22 South
Mapleton, MN 56065
612-382-2783 / 507-524-3859 fax | 17 Western Excelsior Corporation
435 Scenic Drive
Loveland, CO 80537
970-461-2635 / 303-845-8649 fax |
| 8 Erosion Control Blanket
Box 69
Riverton, Manitoba, Canada, R0C 2R0
970-875-1158 / 204-378-2140 fax | 18 Winters Excelsior Company
77 Holly Road
McWilliams, AL 36753
251-746-2563 / 251-746-2579 fax |
| 9 Erosion Tech, LLC
105 Plant Camelia Road
Juliette, GA 31046
478-994-6009 / 478-994-3001 fax | 19 Winters Excelsior Company
406 South Obee Road
Hutchinson, KS 67501
251-746-2563 / 251-746-2579 fax |
| 10 Mid America Erosion Control Products, Inc.
3420 W. Marble Hill Road
Nabb, IN 47147
812-256-7850 / 812-256-5163 fax | |

VENDORS**

- | | | | |
|---|--|----|---|
| 1 | ACF Environmental
914 Callahan Drive, Suite K
Knoxville, TN 37912
865-687-8395 | 7 | MacCafferri, Inc.
10303 Governor Lane Boulevard
Williamsport, MD 21795
301-223-6910 / 301-223-6134 fax |
| 2 | American Excelsior Company
400 Loyola Drive SW
Atlanta, GA 30336
404-344-7877 | 8 | RAC GeoSolutions, LLC
6735 Pinecrest Lane
Pinellas Park, FL 33781
727-433-0813 / 727-329-8445 fax |
| 3 | Belton Industries, Inc.
P.O. Box 127
Belton, SC 29627
800-845-8753 / 800-851-5049 fax | 9 | Southern Environmental Conservation
902 Main Avenue, Suite A
Northport, AL 35476
205-752-1134 / 205-752-1206 fax |
| 4 | Central Seed and Supply
13055 US Highway 11
Springville, AL 35146
205-467-9095 | 10 | Sunshine Supplies, Inc.
1409 Republic Road
Birmingham, AL 35214
800-844-7547 / 205-674-7441 fax |
| 5 | IKEX, Inc.
4983 Perimeter Way, Suite 131
Bessemer, AL 35023
205-428-2007 / 205-428-2266 fax | 11 | Universal ECS, Inc.
5521 Eastcliff Industrial Boulevard
Birmingham, AL 35210
205-838-1400 |
| 6 | L & M Supply Company, Inc.
1800 Springhead Church Road
Willacoochee, GA 31650
800-948-7870 | | |

** This list may not include all vendors.

16 of 17

ESTABLISHED: July 6, 1993
THIS REVISION: July 11, 2007

ALABAMA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

LIST II-20

TACKIFIERS FOR MULCHING

PRODUCT NAME	VENDOR CODE	DATE APPROVED
SECOND NATURE TACPAC-GT	1	07/06/93
SECOND NATURE STRAW TACK FIBER MULCH	1	07/06/93
HYDRO-STIK	2	07/06/93
TERRA-MULCH TACKING AGENT 3	3	08/02/93

VENDORS

1. CENTRAL FIBER CORP
P O BOX 749
WELLSVILLE, KS 66092
2. FINN CORPORATION
9281 LESAINTE DR
FAIRFIELD OH 45014
3. PROFILE PRODUCTS
750 COOK ROAD, SUITE 440
BUFFALO GROVE, IL 60089



INVITATION TO BID NO: 2215350 ADDENDUM NO: 01

STATE OF ALABAMA
DEPARTMENT OF FINANCE
DIVISION OF PURCHASING

REQ. AGENCY : 012001
 : ALA DEPT OF TRANSPORTATION
AGENCY REQ. NO. :
T-NUMBER : TA761
DATE ISSUED : 01/08/10
VENDOR NO. :
VENDOR PHONE NO. :
SNAP REQ. NO. : 1429017
BUYER NAME : SUSAN JANA
BUYER PHONE NO. : (334) 242-7173

INVITATION TO BID ADDENDUM

FOR: EROSION CONTROL PRODUCTS

BID MUST BE RECEIVED BEFORE:
DATE: 01/20/10 TIME: 5:00 PM

BIDS WILL BE PUBLICLY OPENED:
DATE: 01/21/10 TIME: 2:00 PM

PLEASE READ ALL INSTRUCTIONS CAREFULLY

THE FOLLOWING CHANGES ARE HEREBY ADDED TO AND MADE A PART OF
(INVITATION TO BID NUMBER 2215350)

THE PURPOSE OF THIS ADDENDUM IS TO CORRECT THE SPECIFICATIONS ON ONE
LINE OF THE ABOVE REFERENCED ITB, AS WELL AS ADD AN ADDITIONAL LINE.

LINE 00010: DELETE "ARTICLE 610.02 RIPRAP PERMANENT EROSION CONTROL"
AND CHANGE THE RECOMMENDED MDL FROM "GEOTEX 801" TO "GEOTEX 601".

ADD LINE 00016:
COMMODITY CODE 085-85-091720
EROSION CONTROL PRODUCTS AS FOLLOWS:
GEOTEXTILES
PER ALDOT MSDSAR SPECIFICATIONS
LIST II-3

ARTICLE 610.02
RIPRAP PERMANENT EROSION CONTROL

MFR: _____ MDL: _____
PROPEX INC GEOTEX 801 OR EQUAL

QUANTITY: 1 UNIT OF MEASURE: SY UNIT PRICE: \$ _____

THIS ADDENDUM IS ONLY REQUIRED TO BE COMPLETED, SIGNED, AND RETURNED,
INCLUDING A COPY FOR THE REQUIRED COPY OF THE BID, BY VENDORS WHO WISH
TO BID ON THE NEWLY ADDED LINE 16.

(CONTINUED)

STATEMENT OF UNDERSTANDING

I UNDERSTAND THE ADDENDUM AND THAT IT MUST BE SIGNED IN INK AND RETURNED
(UNLESS INDICATED OTHERWISE) WITH THE BID OR SEPARATELY, PROPERLY IDENTIFIED AND
RECEIVED PRIOR TO DATE AND TIME SPECIFIED.

ADDENDUM NOTARIZATION
NOT REQUIRED

COMPANY NAME

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE (INK)

MAIL ADDRESS

TYPE/PRINT AUTHORIZED NAME

CITY, STATE, ZIP

PHONE INCLUDING AREA CODE

VENDOR NAME :

VENDOR NUMBER :

2

01/21/10

2:00 PM

TA761

THE BID RETURN/OPEN DATES/TIMES HAVE BEEN CHANGED, AS SHOWN ABOVE.

SDJ

* * * * * END OF ADDENDUM * * * * *